
DOCKETED 
Docket Number: 22-BSTD-07 

Project Title: Local Ordinance Applications Exceeding the 2022 Energy Code 

TN #: 254319-3 

Document Title: Town of San Anselmo Ordinance NO 1181 

Description: Plain text of San Anselmo ordinance # 1181 

Filer: Danuta Drozdowicz 

Organization: California Energy Commission 

Submitter Role: Commission Staff  

Submission Date: 2/5/2024 12:51:37 PM 

Docketed Date: 2/5/2024 

 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

ORDINANCE NO. 1181 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF SAN ANSELMO REPEALING AND 
REPLACING SAN ANSELMO MUNICIPAL CODE TITLE 9 (BUILDING REGULA TIO NS) CHAPTER 

19 (GREEN BUILDING REQUIREMENTS) TO ADOPT AMENDMENTS TO THE CALIFORNIA 
GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE TO REFLECT LOCAL CONDITIONS 

WHEREAS, green building is a practice of design, construction and maintenance techniques that have been 
demonstrated to have a significant positive effect on energy, water and resource conservation, waste management 
and pollution generation and on the health and productivity of building occupants over the life of the building; 
and 

WHEREAS, on November 24, 2010, the Town Council adopted a Green Building Ordinance, which was codified 
in San Anselmo Municipal Code Title 9, Chapter 19; and 

WHEREAS, on November 12, 2019, the Town Council adopted by reference the California Construction Codes, 
including the 2019 California Green Building Standards Code (CALGreen) (Title 24 Part 11); and 

WHEREAS, on April 28, 2020, the Town Council adopted the County Green Building provisions into the Town 
Municipal Code pursuant to Town Ordinance No. 1145; and 

WHEREAS, on November 15, 2022, the Town Council adopted by reference the California Construction Codes, 
including the 2022 version of CALGreen; and 

WHEREAS, on November 15, 2022, the County of Marin adopted amendments to CALGreen to reflect local 
conditions in the County ("County Green Building Ordinance"); and 

WHEREAS, the San Anselmo Planning Commission discussed San Anselmo's potential adoption of the County 
Green Building Ordinance at its meeting of February 6, 2023; and 

WHEREAS, the San Anselmo Climate Action Commission discussed staff recommendations for adoption of the 
County Green Building Ordinance at its meeting of June 16, 2023 and was supportive of the recommendations; 
and 

WHEREAS, the Town Council discussed the County Green Building Ordinance at its meetings of February 14, 
2023 and June 27, 2023; and 

WHEREAS, the Town Council desires to adopt the County Green Building Ordinance with modifications, as its 
provisions are appropriate for the Town and will allow for more consistent Green Building requirements in Marin 
jurisdictions; 

NOW, THEREFORE, THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF SAN ANSELMO DOES HEREBY 
ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 1. Environmental Review 

Adoption of this Ordinance does not require review under the California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) 
because it does not constitute a "project" pursuant to California Public Resources Code section 21065 and CEQA 
Guidelines section 15378, as its adoption does not involve an activity that has the potential to cause a direct or 
reasonably foreseeable indirect physical change in the environment. 

1 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

SECTION 2. Findings 

Pursuant to Section 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.4 of the California Health and Safety Code, the Town Council of 
the Town of San Anselmo determines that the modifications to the 2022 California Green Building Standards 
Code Chapters 3, 4 and 5, as set forth in this subchapter, are reasonably necessary because of San Anselmo's local 
topographical and environmental conditions. Specifically, the steep terrain, narrow roads, proximity to the San 
Andreas and Hayward seismic faults, and the potential flooding of the San Anselmo Creek are unique conditions 
that require special consideration whenever construction is proposed within the Town. Additionally, due to the 
high temperatures, humidity, rainfall, wind, and the lack of water supply for domestic use and fire suppression, 
the Town is susceptible to wildfires resulting from climate change. 

SECTION 3. Repeal and Replace Title 9 (Building Regulations) Chapter 19 (Green Building 
Requirements). 

San Anselmo Municipal Code Title 9, Chapter 19 is hereby repealed and replaced with the following in its 
entirety. 

9-19.010 Purpose. 

The purpose of this chapter is to meet or exceed all applicable mandatory measures of the California Green 
Building Standards Code known as California Code of Regulations, Part 11 of Title 24 and to enhance the 
long-term public health and welfare by contributing to the overall reduction of greenhouse gas emissions and 
improving the environmental and economic health of the Town through the efficient design, construction, 
operation, maintenance and deconstruction of buildings and site development by incorporating green building 
practices and materials. 

The green building provisions referenced in this chapter are designed to achieve the following objectives in 
San Anselmo: 

(1) Increase energy efficiency in buildings; 
(2) Reduce consumption of fossil fuels; 
(3) Encourage water and resource conservation; 
(4) Reduce waste generated by construction projects; 
(5) Reduce long-term building operating and maintenance costs; 
(6) Improve indoor air quality and occupant health; 
(7) Contribute to meeting state and local commitments to reduce greenhouse gas emissions; and 
(8) Satisfy all applicable mandatory measures of the 2022 California Green Building Standards 

Code (Title 24, Part 11) of the California Code of Regulations. 

9-19.015 - Applicability. 

The provisions of this chapter shall apply to all construction or development projects defined below as a 
"covered project." 

9-19.020 - Definitions. 

For the purposes of interpreting this chapter and the associated standards for compliance, the following terms 
are defined as follows. When the definitions below differ from those contained elsewhere in this title, the 
provisions of this chapter shall apply. These definitions are additional to those outlined in Chapter 2 of the 
CALGreen Code. 

(1) "2022 California Energy Code" refers to the requirements outlined in the 2022 edition of the 
California Energy Code known as California Code of Regulations, Part 6 of Title 24. 

2 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

(2) "All-electric Building" or "All-electric Design" means a building or plans for a building that uses 
a permanent supply of electricity as the source of energy for all space heating (including but not 
limited to fireplaces), water heating (including but not limited to pools and spas), cooking appliances 
(including but not limited to barbeques), and clothes drying appliances, and has no natural gas or 
propane plumbing installed in the building or within the property lines. An all-electric building may 
also include solar thermal collectors. 

(3) "Accessory Dwelling Unit (ADU)" means a residential unit that meets the definition of an 
accessory dwelling unit as outlined in Section 10-6.102 of the San Anselmo Municipal Code, Title 
10, Chapter 6. This states that "an attached or detached residential dwelling unit that provides 
complete independent living facilities for one (1) or more persons and is located on the same lot as 
the proposed or existing primary residence. It shall include permanent provisions for living, sleeping, 
eating, cooking, and sanitation. An accessory dwelling unit also includes an efficiency unit, as 
defined in Section 17958.1 of the Health and Safety Code, and a manufactured home, as defined in 
Section 18007 of the Health and Safety Code." For purposes of this subchapter, ADU also covers 
Junior ADUs and detached or attached ADUs. 

(4) "Automatic Load Management System (ALMS)" means a control system designed to manage 
load across one or more electric vehicle supply equipment (EVSE), circuits, panels, and to share 
electrical capacity and/or automatically manage power at each connection point. ALMS systems 
shall be designed to deliver no less than 3.3 kVa (208/240 volt, 16-ampere) to each EV Capable, EV 
Ready or EVCS space served by the ALMS, and meet the requirements of California Electrical Code 
Article 625. The connected amperage to the building site for the EV charging infrastructure shall not 
be lower than the required connected amperage per California Green Building Standards Code, Title 
24Part11. 

(5) "CALGreen" refers to the California Green Building Standards Code, as included in Title 24, Part 
11 of the California Code of Regulations. 

(6) "CALGreen mandatory" means those measures that are required under Title 24, Part 11. 
Residential mandatory measures are contained in CALGreen Chapter 4. Nonresidential mandatory 
measures are contained in CALGreen Chapter 5. 

(7) "CALGreen Tier l" refers to required pre-requisite and elective measures in addition to the 
CALGreen mandatory measures, as outlined in CAL Green Appendix A4.601.4 for residential 
projects and CALGreen Appendix A5.601.2 for nonresidential projects. 

(8) "Commercial Kitchen" means non-retail food facility devoted to the commercial preparation, 
production, and cooking of food and beverages for on-site or off-site consumption. 

(9) "Conductor Ready" means adding 10 gauge 4 wire for any laundry room remodel for future 
appliance electric upgrades and/or adding 8 gauge 4 wire for any kitchen remodel for future appliance 
electric upgrades. 

(10) "Cooking Equipment" means equipment intended for commercial use, including ovens, ranges, 
and cooking appliances for use in a commercial kitchen and restaurant where food is dispensed. 

(11) "Covered Project(s)" means a development project provided below as set forth by the standards 
for compliance outlined in Section 9-19.050 of the San Anselmo Municipal Code, Table 1, 2, or 3 for 
which one or more building permits are required: 

3 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

(i) All residential and nonresidential new construction buildings as defined below in Section 
9-19.020 (28); and/or 
(ii) Additions or alterations to an existing Single-Family residential building, except for any 
projects less than 750 square feet. Conductor ready required for laundry room and kitchen 
remodels regardless of remodel size. 
(iii) Substantial Improvements to an existing Single-Family residential building. 

(12) "Direct Current Fast Charging (DCFC)" means a parking space provided with electrical 
infrastructure that meets the following conditions: 

(i) A minimum of 48 kVa (480 volt, JOO-ampere) capacity wiring. 
(ii) Electric vehicle supply equipment (EVSE) located within three (3) feet of the parking 
space providing a minimum capacity of SO-ampere. 

(13) "Electric Vehicle (EV) Capable Space" means a vehicle space with electrical panel space and 
load capacity to support a branch circuit and necessary raceways, both underground and/or surface 
mounted, to support EV charging. 

(14) "Electric Vehicle (EV) Ready Space" means a vehicle space which is provided with a branch 
circuit; any necessary raceways, both underground and/or surface mounted, to support EV charging, 
terminating in a receptacle or a charger. 

(15) "Electric Vehicle Charging Space (EV Space)" means a space intended for future installation 
of EV charging equipment and charging of electric vehicles. 

(16) "Electric Vehicle Charging Station (EVCS)" means a parking space that includes installation 
of electric vehicle supply equipment (EVSE) at an EV Ready space. An EVCS space may be used to 
satisfy EV Ready space requirements. EVSE shall be installed in accordance with the California 
Electrical Code, Article 625. 

(17) "Level 1 (L 1) EV Ready" means a parking space that is served by a complete electric circuit 
with the following requirements: 

(i) A minimum of2.2 kVa (110/120 yolt, 20-ampere) capacity wiring. 
(ii) A receptacle labeled "Electric Vehicle Outlet" or electric vehicle supply equipment 
located within three (3) feet of the parking space. IfEVSE is provided the minimum capacity 
of the EVSE shall be 16-ampere. 
(iii) Conduit oversized to accommodate future Level 2 EV Ready (208/240 volt, 40-
ampere) at each parking space. 

(18) "Level 2 (L2) EV Ready" means a parking space that is served by a complete electric circuit 
with the following requirements: 

(i) A minimum of8.3 kVa (208/240 volt, 40-ampere) capacity wiring. 
(ii) A receptacle labeled "Electric Vehicle Outlet" or electric vehicle supply equipment 
located within three (3) feet of the parking space. IfEVSE is provided the minimum capacity 
of the EVSE shall be 30-ampere. 

(19) "Electric Vehicle Supply Equipment (EVSE)" means the conductors, including the 
undergrounded, grounded and equipment grounding conductors and the electric vehicle 
connectors, attachment plugs, and all other fittings, devices, power outlets or apparatus 
installed for the purpose of transferring energy between the premises wiring and the electric 
vehicle. 

4 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

(20) "Essential Services Building" means a facility as defined by the California Health and Safety 
Code section 16007, as amended from time to time. For purposes of this chapter, essential services 
buildings are publicly owned and/or publicly operated buildings whose purpose is to safeguard the 
public health and safety. Essential services buildings generally exclude privately owned residences 
and/or commercial buildings; except that, privately owned commercial buildings may qualify as 
essential services buildings to the extent they are publicly operated to safeguard the public health and 
safety. 

(21) "Food Service Establishment" means any new construction building with construction plans 
for a commercial kitchen or cooking equipment. 

(22) "Industrial process heat" shall be defined as a process or manufacturing equipment for which 
sustained temperatures typically in excess of three hundred fifty degrees Fahrenheit are required and 
demonstrably not achievable with commercial electric equipment. 

(23) "Low Power Level 2 Electric Vehicle Charging Receptacle" means a parking space that is 
served by a complete electric circuit with the following requirements: 

(i) A minimum of 4.1 kVa (208/240 volt, 20-ampere) capacity wiring. 
(ii) A receptacle labeled "Electric Vehicle Outlet" or electric vehicle supply equipment 
located within three (3) feet of the parking space. IfEVSE is provided the minimum capacity 
of the EVSE shall be 16-ampere. 
(iii) Conduit oversized to accommodate future level 2 EV Ready (208/240 volt, 40-
ampere) at each parking space. 

(24) "Mixed-fuel" means a building or unit in a building that is plumbed for the use ofnatural gas 
or propane as fuel for space heating, water heating, cooking or clothes drying appliances or has gas 
plumbing within a building or within the property lines of the premises connected to a gas meter or 
propane tank. 

(25) "Modified parking lot" shall be those for which paving material and curbing is removed. 

(26) "Natural gas" is the same meaning as "Fuel Gas" as defined in the California Plumbing Code 
and Mechanical Code. 

(27) "Natural gas infrastructure" means fuel gas piping, other than service pipe, in or in 
connection with a building, structure or within the property lines of premises, extending from the 
point of delivery at the meter, service meter assembly, outlet of the service regulator, service shutoff 
valve, or final pressure regulator, whichever is applicable, as specified in the California Mechanical 
Code and Plumbing Code. 

(28) "Newly Constructed" means a building that has never before been used or occupied for any 
purpose. Also means "Newly Constructed" as defined in the California Building Code 2022. 

(29) "Qualified green building rater" means an individual who has been trained and certified as a 
CALGreen inspector, LEED AP w/a specialty, GreenPoint rater, PHIUS consultant, or has similar 
qualifications and certifications if acceptable to the chief building official. 

(30) "Single-Family" means a building designed for and/or occupied exclusively by one family. It 
is used herein to describe one and two-family dwellings and townhouses with attached private 
garages. It also includes factory-built, modular housing units, constructed in compliance with the 
California Building 

5 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

(31) "Substantial Improvement" means any repair, reconstruction, rehabilitation, alteration, 
addition or other improvement of a building or structure, the cost of which equals or exceeds 50 
percent of the market value of the structure before the improvement or repair is started. If the 
structure has sustained substantial damage, any repairs are considered substantial improvement 
regardless of the actual repair work performed. The term does not, however, include either: 

1. Any project for improvement of a building required to correct existing health, sanitary or 
safety code violations identified by the building official and that are the minimum necessary 
to assure safe living conditions. 
2. Any alteration of a historic structure provided that the alteration will not preclude the 
structure's continued designation as a historic structure. 

9-19.030 - Requirements for additions and alterations - Local amendments to 2022 California Energy 
Code. 

Pursuant to Section 9-1.101 (h) of the San Anselmo Municipal Code, the Town has adopted the 2022 
edition of the California Energy Code known as California Code of Regulations, Part 6 of Title 24 with additions, 
and deletions as provided in this subchapter. 

The provisions of this subchapter shall constitute local amendments to the cross-referenced provisions of 
the 2022 California Energy Code and shall be deemed to replace the cross-referenced sections of said Code with 
the respective provisions set forth in this subchapter. 

The California Energy Code, Title 24, Part 6, is hereby amended as underlined and struck through: 

Section 100.0 of Subchapter 1 of the 2022 California Energy Code is modified to add new section (i) as follows: 
(i) Single-Family Building Remodel Energy Reach Code - Purpose and Intent. In addition to all 
requirements of the California Energy Code applicable to Existing Single-Fam Uy Building additions and 
alterations. the energy efficiency and renewable energy measures specified in Section I 50.0(w) shall be 
required for Covered Projects of mixed-fuel buildings. 

Section 100. l(b) is modified by adding the following definitions: 
"All-electric Building" or "All-electric Design" as defined in §9-19.020 (2) of the San Anselmo 
Municipal Code. 
"Covered Project(s)" as defined in §9-19.020 (11), of the San Anselmo Municipal Code. 
"Mixed-fuel" building as defined in §9-19.020 (24), of the San Anselmo Municipal Code. 

Section 150.0 SINGLE-FAMILY RESIDENTIAL BUILDINGS - MANDA TORY FEATURES AND DEVICES, 
first two paragraphs, are modified to read as follows: 

Existing Single-Family residential buildings shall comply with the applicable requirements of Sections 
150(a) through 150.0(v), and Covered Existing Single-Family Projects, other than projects identified as 
al.I-electric construction for new residential buildings in §9-24.01 et seq. ofthe San Anselmo Municipal 
Code. shall comply with the applicable requirements of Section 150.0(w). 

NOTE: The requirements of Sections 150.0(a) through 150.0(v) apply to new construction. Sections 
150.2(a) and 150.2(b) specify which requirements of Sections 150.0(a) through 150.0(v) also apply to 
additions or alterations, with the exception that Covered Existing Single-Family Projects. other than 
projects identified as all-electric construction for new residential buildings in §9-24.01 et seq. of the San 
Anselmo Municipal Code, shall also be required to comply with Section 150.0(w). 

6 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

A new Section, (w), is added to Section 150.0 as follows: 
(w) Requirements for a Covered Project are outlined by project type in Table 1 of Section 9-19.050 of 
the San Anselmo Municipal Code. A Covered Existing Single-Family Project, as defined in Section 9-
19.020 (11 )(ii) of the San Anselmo Municipal Code, that includes an electrical panel upgrade, a kitchen 
remodel or a laundry room remodel shall comply with the requirements for Measure ER2 in Table 2 of 
Section 9-19.050 of the San Anselmo Municipal Code. In addition, a Covered Existing Single-Family 
Project in a building originally permitted for construction on or before December 31, 2010 shall install a 
set of measures from the Measure Menu in Table 2 of Section 9-19.050 of the San Anselmo Municipal 
Code, to achieve a total Measure Point Score that is equal to or greater than the Target Score in said table 
and shall conform to the List of Measure Specifications in Table 3 of Section 9-19.050 of the San 
Anselmo Municipal Code, except as otherwise described below: 

(i) Projects identified as all-electric construction for new residential buildings in Section 9-24.01 
et. seq. of the San Anselmo Municipal Code. 
(ii) Projects less than 750 square feet that are not considered Substantial Improvements. 
(iii) Projects that are limited solely to a newly created attached Accessory Dwelling Units 
(ADUs) or Junior Accessory Dwelling Unit (JADU) as defined in Section 9-19.020 (3), San 
Anselmo Municipal Code. A newly created ADU and JADU shall include either additions or 
conversions of existing space. 
(iv) Mobile Homes, Manufactured Housing, or Factory-built Housing as defined in Division 13 of 
the California Health and Safety 12 Code ( commencing with section 17000 of the Health and 
Safety Code). 
(v) If due to conditions specific to the project, it is technically or economically infeasible to 
achieve compliance, the chief building official may reduce the Target Score and/or waive some or 
all of the mandatory requirements. 
(vi) If the applicant demonstrates that the Energy Budget of the proposed building, as calculated 
under Section 150.l(b), would be less than or equal to the Energy Budget of the building ifit 
otherwise complied with this Section, 150.0(w). 
(vii) A resident owner or occupant demonstrates that they qualify for the California Alternative 
Rates for Energy (CARE) or Family Electric Rate Assistance (FERA) program may comply by 
installing, to the specifications in Table 3 of Section 9-19.050 of the San Anselmo Municipal 
Code the following: 

(a) El: Lighting Measures; and 
(b) E2: Water Heating Package 

In addition, all mandatory measures listed in Table 2 of Section 9-19.050 of the San Anselmo 
Municipal Code shall be installed. 

9-19.040 Requirements for Electric Vehicle Infrastructure - Local amendments to 2022 CALGreen 
California Green Building Standards Code. 

Pursuant to Section 9-1.101 (j) of the San Anselmo Municipal Code, the Town has adopted the 2022 
edition of the California Green Building Standards Code known as California Code of Regulations, Part 11 of 
Title 24 (herein referred to as CALGreen Code), including Division A4.6 for Tier 1 with additions, and deletions 
as provided in this subchapter. Requirements are outlined by project type in Table 1 of Section 9-19 .050 of the 
San Anselmo Municipal Code. 

The provisions of this subchapter shall constitute local amendments to the cross-referenced provisions of 
the 2022 CALGreen Code and shall be deemed to replace the cross-referenced sections of said Code with the 
respective provisions set forth in this subchapter. 

7 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

Section 202 of Chapter 2 of the 2022 CALGreen Code is hereby amended as underlined and struck 
through: 

Automatic Load Management System (ALMS). A control system designed to manage load across one or 
more electric vehicle supply equipment (EVSE), circuits, panels and to share electrical capacity and/or 
automatically manage power at each connection point. ALMS systems shall be designed to deliver no less 
than 3.3 kVa (208/240 volt, 16-ampere) to each EV Capable, EV Ready or EVCS space served by the 
ALMS, and meet the requirements ofCalifornia Electrical Code Article 625. The connected amperage to 
the building site for the EV charging infrastructure shall not be lower than the required connected 
amperage per California Green Building Standards Code, Title 24 Part 11. 

Direct Current Fast Charging (DCFC). A parking space provided with electrical infrastructure that meets 
the following conditions: 
i. A minimum of 48 kVa (480 volt, I 00-ampere) capacity wiring. 

ii. Electric vehicle supply equipment <EVSE) located within three (3) feet of the parking space 
providing a minimum capacity of 80-ampere. 

Electric Vehicle Charging Station (EVCS). One or FR0Fe eleetrie ¥ehiele charging spaees sePreEI ey 
eleetrie ¥ehiele eharger(s) or ot:l~er ehargieg equipment allowing ohar~ing of eleetrie vehioles. Bleetrie 
¥ehiole chargi:ng stations are not eonsiElereEI parking spaees. A parking space that includes installation of 
electric vehi.cle supply equipment (EVSE) at an EV Ready space. An EVCS space may be used to satisfy 
EV Ready space requirements. EVSE shall be installed in accordance with the California Electrical Code, 
Article 625. 

Electric Vehicle (EV) Ready Space. [HCD] A vehicle space which is provided with a branch circuit; any 
necessary raceways, both underground and/or surface mounted; to accommodate EV charging, 
terminating in a receptacle or a charger. 

Electric Vehicle (EV) Capable Space. A vehicle space with electrical panel space and load capacity to 
support a branch circuit and necessary raceways, both underground and/or surface mounted, to support 
EV charging. 

Level 2 (L2) EV Capable. A parking space provided with electrical infrastructure that meets the following 
requirements: 

i. Conduit that links a listed electrical panel with sufficient capacity to a junction box or receptacle located 
within three (3) feet of the parking space. 

ii. The conduit shall be designed to accommodate at least 8.3 kYa (208/240 volt 40-ampere) per parking 
space. Conduit shall have a minimum nominal trade size of 1 inch inside diameter and may be sized for 
mu]tiple circuits as allowed by the California Electrical Code. Conduit shall be installed at a minimum in 
spaces that will be inaccessible after construction, either trenched underground or where penetrations to 
walls, floors, or other partitions would otherwise be required for future installation ofbranch circuits. and 
such addi.tional elements deemed necessary by the Building Official. Construction documents shall 
indi.cate future completion of conduit from the panel to the parking space, via the installed inaccessible 
conduit. 

iii. The electrical panel shall reserve a space for a 40-ampere overcurrent protective device space(s) for EV 
charging, labeled in the panel directory as "EV CAPABLE." 

iv. Electrical load calculations shall demonstrate that the electrical panel service capacity and electrical 
system. inclucting any on-site distribution transforrner(s}. have sufficient capacity to simultaneously 
charge all EVs at all required EV spaces at a minimwn of40 amperes. 

8 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

v. The parking space shall contain signage with at least a 12" font adjacent to the parking space indicating 
the space is EV Capable. 

Level 1 (Lt) EV Ready. A parking space that is served by a complete electric circuit with the folJowing 
requirements: 

i. A minimum of2.2 kVa (110/120 vol'!, 20-ampere) capacity wiring. 
ii. A receptacle labeled "Electric Vehicle Outlet' or electric vehicle supply equipment located within three 

(3) feet of the parking space. If EVSE is provided the minimum capacily of the EVSE shall be 16-ampere. 
iii. Conduit oversized to accommodate future Level 2 EV Ready (208/240 volt. 40-ampere) at each parking 

space. 

Level 2 (L2) EV Ready. A parking space that is served by a complete electric circuit with the following 
requirements: 

i. A minimum of 8.3 kVa (208/240 volt, 40-ampere) capacity wiring. 
ii. A rece tacle labeled' Electric Vehicle Outlet" or electric vehicle su e ui ment located within three 

3 feet of the arkin s ace. If EVSE is rovided the minimum ca acit of the EVSE shall be 30-am ere. 

Low Power Level 2 (L2) EV Ready. A parking space that is served by a complete electric circuit with the 
following requirements: 

i. A minimum of 4.1 kV A (208/240 Volt. 20-ampere) capacity wiring. 
ii. A receptacle labeled "Electric Vehicle Outlet" or electric vehicle supply equipment located within three 

(3) feet of the parking space. If EVSE is provided the minimum capacity of the EYSE shall be 16-ampere. 
iii. Conduit oversized to accommodate future Level 2 EV Ready (208/240 volt. 40-ampere) at each parking 

space. 

bew Pew<#" Level 2 fileel,rie Vehief.e (EV) Gl1t3rging Reeeef0ele. [HGD] A 2081240 Volt 2Q aA'lpere R11n1rfHIFR 
braneh eire1::1it at=10 a reeeptaele for use b,· ae SV elri:Yer to charge their electrie vehicle or hybrie eleelrie ·,eh:iele. 

Off-Street Loading Spaces. [BSC-CG, DSA-SS] An area, other than a public stre'et, public way, or other 
property (and exclusive of off-street parking spaces), permanently reserved or set aside for the loading or 
unloading of motor vehicles, including ways of ingress and egress and maneuvering areas. Whenever the term 
"loading space" is used, it shall, unless the context clearly requires otherwise, be construed as meaning off-street 
loading space. This excludes designated passenger loading/unloading. 

Section 301.1 of Chapter 3 of the 2022 CALGreen Code is hereby amended as underlined and struck 
through: 

301.1 Scope. Buildings shall be designed to comply with applicable requirements of San Anselmo Green 
Building Requirements beginning at Section 9-19.010, San Anselmo Municipal Code, and shall also 
include the green building measures specified as mandatory in the application checklists contained in this 
code. Voluntary green b1:1ilding measures are also i:Relueee in ~e ap13iieation eheelc!ist:s at=tel may he 
ineh1ded in tl:te design at=tel eonstruetioR ef slfuetl::!Fes ee:Ye:reel b;· this eeele but are r10t refjuired 1:1nless 
aelopted ay a eity eeunty, or eity and eelillty as speeified in Seetie.n IO 1.7. 

Section 301.1.1 of Chapter 3 of the 2022 CALGreen Code is hereby amended as underlined and struck 
through: 

301.1.1 Additions and alterations. [HCD] The mandatory provisions of Chapter 4 shall be applied to 
additions and alterations of existing residential buildings wl=!ere tl=ie adeition or alteration inereases tl=ie 
eliileling's eonditioReel a.rea, 'lolume or si2:e., in accordance with applicable requirements of San Anselmo 
Green Building Requirements begi·nning at Section 9-19.0 I 0, San Anselmo Municipal Code. The 
requirements shall apply only to and/or within the specific area of the addition or alteration. 

9 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

The mandatory provisions of section 4.106.4.Lll may apply to additions or alterations of existing 
parking facilities or the addition of new parking facilities or the addition of new parking facilities serving 
existing multifamily buildings. See Section 4.106.4.UJ for application. 

NOTE: Repairs including, but not limited to, resurfacing, restriping, and repairing or maintaining 
existing lighting fixtures are not considered alterations for the purpose of this section. 

Section 301.3 of Chapter 3 of the 2022 CALGreen Code is hereby amended as underlined and struck 
through: 

301.3 Nonresidential additions and alterations. [BSC-CG] The provisions of individual sections of 
Chapter 5 apply to new construction and building additions and alterations of 1,000 square feet er greater, 
and/or building alterations with a peFA'l:lt \·aluation ef$200,000 or ab01t<e (for occupancies within the 
authority of California Building standards Commission). Code sections relative to additions and 
alterations shall only apply to the portions of the building being added or altered within the scope of the 
permitted work. 

Section 4.106.4 of Chapter 4 of the 2022 CALGreen Code is hereby amended as underlined and struck 
through: 

4.106.4 Electric vehicle (EV) charging for Bew eoBstruetion. Ne1A' Residential construction shall 
comply with Section 4.106.4.1 or 4.106.4.2 to facilitate future installation and use of EV chargers. 
Electric vehicle supply equipment (EVSE) shall be installed in accordance with the California Electrical 
Code, Article 625. For EVCS signs, refer to Caltrans Traffic Operations Policy Directive 13-01 {Zero 
Emission Vehicle Signs and Pavement Markings) or its successor(s). Calculation for spaces shall be 
rounded up to the nearest whole number. 

Exceptions: 
1. On a case-by-case basis, where the local enforcing agency has determined EV charging and 

infrastructure are not feasible based upon one or more of the following conditions: 
1.1. Where there is no local utility power supply or the local utility is unable to supply 

adequate power. 
1.2. Where there is evidence suitable to the local enforcing agency substantiating that 

additional local utility infrastructure design requirements, directly related to the 
implementation of Section 4.106.4, may adversely impact the construction cost of the 
project. 

2. Accessory Dwelling Units (ADU) and Junior Accessory Dwelling Units (JADU) without additional 
parking facilities and without electrical panel upgrade or new panel installation. Detached ADUs, 
attached ADUs and JADUs without additional arkin but with electrical anel u rades or new 
panels must have reserved breakers and electrical capacity according to the requirements of 
A4.106.8.1. 

3. Multifamily building projects that have approved entitlements before the code effective date. 
4. Parking spaces accessible only by automated mechanical car parking systems are not required to 

comply with this code section. 

4.19,.4.1 New one end two family dwellings and towe houses '111ith pci'l&te garages. For eash 
elwelliAg unit, install a listed raceway to accommodate a eleelieated 208 240 volt braneh eirauit. The 
raeeway shall not be less than a=ade siz:e I (nemiAal l iael=i inside di.ameter). The raceway shall originate at 
the main serviee or subpaAel and shall terminate into a lis~ed cabinet, box or other enclosure in close 
proximity to the proposed location of an BV eharger. Race•Nays are required t:o be eontint1eus at enelosed, 
inaeeessible or concealed areas aAd spaees. The serviee=panel M'ldter subpanel shall pre•,ride eapaeity to 

https://4.106.4.UJ


DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

install a 40 ampe.Fe 208/240 1,•olt minii:r11:1B'I Elediea~eEi brat1eh eiret1it an/ii space(s) reserves to pem1it 
installation of a braneh eiret1it o•terot1rrent 13roteotivo Ele1,•iee. 
B~rnoption: ATaeoway is not reE}:1:1ired if a mi-ni:mum 40 ampere 208/240 volt dedioateEi 6V bFaneh oirot1it 
is icAstaHed in elose fJFOXimity to the fJFOposed loeati<m of an EV oharger at the time oforiginal 
eonstn1otion ie aooerela:noe wits tche C£dijo,•·Hie El:eelrieel G96f.e. 

4.10(,.4,l.l ldeetifieetiee. The service panel er s1:1bpa:F1el eiro1:1:it eiiJeet0I)' shall .ielentify tho O't'0FGl:lffent 
proteoth•e device space(s) reser¥ed for future EV charging as BV CAPABLE . The raceway termination 
location sl:iaU be pem1ooently and ¥isibly marked as EV CAPABLe '. 

4.106.4.U New-mMultifamily dwellings, hotels end motels eed with new parking facilities. Requirements 
a I. to arkin s aces that are assi ned or leased to individual dwell in units as well as unassi ned residential 
parking. Visitor or common area parking is not included. 

4.106.4.1.1 New Construction. Fifteen percent (15%) ofdwelling units with parking spaces shall be 
EVCS with Level 2 EV Ready. ALMS shaJI be permitted to reduce load when multiple vehicles are 
charging. Eighty-five percent (85%) of dwelling units with parking spaces shall be provided with a Low 
Power Level 2 EV Ready space. EV ready spaces and EVCS in multifamily developments shall comply 
with California Building Code, Chapter 1lA, Section 1109A. EVCS shall comply with the accessibility 
provisions for EV chargers in the California Building Code. Chapter 118. 

NOTE: The total number of EV spaces should be one-hundred percent ( 100%) of dwelling units or one
hundred percent (I 00%) of parking spaces, whichever is less. 

4.106.4.1.2 Additions and alterations of existing buildings. 
1. When parking facilities upgrade the service panel or parking lot surface is modified, including the 

removal of paving material and curbing. comply with the number of spaces designated for the 
project type as outlined in Table I of Section 9-19.050 of the San Anselmo Municipal Code. 
Upgrades shall be required at currently designated vehicle parking spaces. Upgrades shall be 
required for remaining parking spaces after meeting the accessibility requirements of California 
Building Code Chapters 1 lA and 1 lB. 

2. When new parking facilities are added and ALMS is installed. the ALMS system must be 
designed to deliver no less than 2.2 kVa (110/120 volt, 20-ampere). 

When parking is pro•tieled, flilFking s13aees fer new FH1:1:ltifamily d1,\<ellings, 1--iatels aHd matels sha:1.1 FHeet 
the requiremen~ of SectioflS 4. I0t:i.4.2.1 aHEI 4.1 Qe.4 .2.2. Caleulations fer spaces shall ee rouneleEi u13 to 
the nearest whole nuinber. A 13arking s13ace serveEI ey eleekic ,·ehiele supply eq1.1i13meF1t OF designed as a 
future EV charging space shall count as at least oee standarEi automobile parking space only for the 
purpose of eomplying with any applieable mi:nimum parking space reEjt1ireme11ts establislied by a loeal 
jt1risdietion. See Vel=tiele Code Seetion 22511.2 for .fl:l:rtl:ler details. 

4.18(,.4.2.1 Multifamily develepment prnjeds with less thee 20 ElweUit1g BHits; eed hetels eed metels with 
less thee 20 sleepieg 11eits or guest roems. 
The number of dwelling units, sleetJing 1:1nits or g1:1est roams shall be based on all b1:1ilain:gs on a projeot site 
s1:1bjeet ~0 this sectioa. 

a. EV Capable. Ten (10) pereenl of tl=te toffi:I number of 13arking spaces Ofl a building site, pro.,·ided fer a:11 
types of parking faeilities shall be el.ectric ,•el=tiele charging spaees (BV spaces) oapaele of supporting 
future Le·,·el 2 EVSK Bleetrioa:l load oaleulations sl:iall Eiemonstrate H:iat the eleetrieal paRel service 
ea13aeity and eleetrieal systeFA, including any on site distribution transformer(s), Aa>re suffieient capacity 
to siernltane·o.usly charge all BVs at all required EV spaces at a rniniFAum of 4g amperes. 

11 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

The service panel or subpanel oireuit direotory st:iall identify the o¥ereurrent protective device space(s) 
Fesen•ed feF fut1¥e EVoAar~ing purposes as "eV CAPABLE" in aeeordanee with the California 
Blectrieal Code. 

Exceptions: 
I. When EV ehargers (be•,<el 2 EVSE) are installed in a n1:1mber equ~ ~o or greater tFJan the tequired 
nuffieer of EV eapable spaees. 
2. When EV chargers (Level 2 EVS~ are installed in a nuffieer less than tl:\e requiree nllffleer of EV 
eapaele spaces, tke nun11=Jer of BV eapaele spaces ret11:1ires 1:nay 00 Fea1:1eee 0y a n1:1m0er eq1:1al to tFJe 
n1:1m0er ofEV chargers installes. 
Net0!r. 

a. GoestF1:1etion deel:lmeets are inteneled to dem.oBslrate the project s eapabili.ty and capacity for 
facilitating futw:e BY eliargiAg. 
a. Tliere is no requiFOment for EV st3aeesto be eoestrneted or a¥ailable until reeeptoeles for EV 
eharging or BY chargers are installed for 1:150. 

b. E\' Reedy. Twen~ fi,.,e (25) percent of the total nuFRber of parking spaces shall be eq1:1ippea witl=i low 
power Le•,cel 2 EV ehargiRg rece13taeles. For rn1:1ltiffl:fflily 13arking faeilities, eo FRore than one receptacle is 
requires per dwel Iing U:Rit when Blore tl=tan one 13arkiflg s13aee is 13ro•,cided for use by a sil=1gle dwelling 
tifHt-; 

Ex:oeption: Areas of 13ark.ing faoilities served by parkit1g lifts. 

4.19(;.4.2.2 Multifamily de\•elof)ment f)Fejeets with 20 OF IHOFC dwellieg eeits, hotels aed motels with 20 OF 
moFe sleepi:Bg units OF guest rooms. 
The number of swelling units, sleeping units or guest rooms sh.all be bases on all buildings on a project site 
s1:1b;jeet to this section. 

a. E:V Cepal:Jle. Ten ( 10) percent of tl=te tom! nuffiber of parking spaees OR a builei:Ag site, provisee for 
all types of 13arking faeilities shall be eleotrio ¥ehiole eharging spaees (SV spaees) oapable ofsup13orting 
future be.•,cel 2 El.VSS. Bleotrieal loas ealoulations sba!I demoRst:Fate that the electrical 13anel serYiee 
eapaeity aREl eleetrioal system inell:lding any on site distrib1:1tion transfom1er(s), ha¥e sttffieieRt eaJ)aoi~ 
to siBlultaneously charge all 6Vs at all required El.V spaees at a miniml:lm of 40 a1'Flperes. 

Tl=te servieo paF1el or s1:10panel oireuit aireetory shall iEleAtify ~he overe1:1rrent proteeth•e de,·iee spaee(s) 
reser.,es for fut1:.1re 6\1 ol=targing purposes as ' EV CAPABbe" in accordanee with the California 
Bleetrieal Code. 

eM.oeptioA: WheA EV ehargers (bevel 2 BVS.6) are iMtalled iA a number greater than :fiye (5) 
13eroent of parkiAg spaces required~· Section 4.lOe.4.2.2, Item 3, the enmber of EV eapable 
spaces required may be resueed 0y a number equal ta ~e AUfflber of 6'1 cl=largeEs installes o,·er 
the fi•,ce (5) 13ereent requiTee. 

Netest 
a. Gm,stmetion documents are i11teneeel to aemonstrate the 13rojeot's ea13a0ility and ca13aoity fer 
faeilitating future EV ohargieg. 
0. There is no requ~rement for EV s13aees to be consll'Ueted or a•1ailable until receptacles for E.V 
charging or BV ehargers are installed. :for use. 

b. EV Ready. Twenty fiye (25) peroent of the total nl:lfl'lber of parking spaces sl=tall be equip13ee with low 
pov,'er bevel 2 EW charging reeeptaeles. !2orm1:1ltifarnily parking facilities, no Rlore than one receptaole is 
requires per ewelliAg unit whefl more tl=tan one parki11g space is 13rovieles for 1:1se by a single ewellillg 
tifHt-; 

12 

https://eapabili.ty


DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

BKeeptioe: Areas of parking faei Ii ties seF\1eEi by parking lifts. 

e. EV Chargers. Fi'>'e (5) pereent af tl:!e tatal n1:1mber of parking spaoes sl~all be equippecl with LeYel 2 
BYSE. Whei=e eamrnon use 13arldHg is 13rovi00EI., at least oee E.V eharger shall be looatecl iR the ooRUROR 
use parking area aed shall be a-.•ailable f:or 1:1se by all resiclents er gtiest-s. 

Wl3eR low power bevel 2 EV oharging reooptaelos or be¥el 2 BYSE are iestalled beyond the miRim1:1m 
reqU:ireEi, aR. atHomatio loael fflanageffleRt system (ALMS) may be Hsecl to reauee the max.imHm reqHired 
eleotrieal ea13aeity to eaeh spaee seFYeel by the ALMS. The eleetrieal system aAd any OR site distribl:ltioR 
transformers shaH i:t&,'e suffieieRt oaf:)aeity to Elelh<er at least 3.3 kW sim1:1ltaRem1sly to eaeh eV eharging 
station (8:VCS) served by the ALMS. The braneh eireuit shal I ha-.10 a mieimum oapaeity of 4 0 am13eres 
and installed 81/Se shall l'la-.•e a eapaeity ofnat less tRaR 30 amperes. ALMS shall aot be usecl to reeiuee 
the minimum required eleetrieal eapaeity to the required EV ea13able s13aees. 

4.106.4.J.~ Electric vehicle charging stations (EVCS). 
Electric vehicle charging stations required by Section 4. l 06.4.12.2 lte1n 3 and 4.106.4.2, shall comply 
with Section 4.106.4.JH,+. 

Exception: Electric vehicle charging stations serving public accommodations, public housing, motels, 
and hotels shall not be required to comply with this section. See California Building Code, Chapter l l B, 
for applicable requirements. 

4.106.4.3.1:2.2.1.1 Location. 
EVCS shall comply with at least one of the following options: 

1. The charging space shall be located adjacent to an accessible parking space meeting the 
requirements of the California Building Code, Chapter 1 lA, to allow use of the EV charger from the 
accessible parking space. 

2. The charging space shall be located on an accessible route, as defined in the California Building 
Code, Chapter 2, to the building. 

Exception: Electric vehicle charging stations designed and constructed in compliance with the 
California Building Code, Chapter l I B, are not required to comply with Section 4. l 06.4.ll~ 
and Section 4.106.4.3.2~, Item 3. 

4.106.4.3.22,2.1,2 Eleetf'ie ,•ehiele ehergieg stations (EVCS) El Dimensions. 
The charging spaces shall be designed to comply with the following: 

1. The minimum length of each EV space shall be l 8 feet (5486 mm). 
2. The minimum width of each EV space shall be 9 feet (2743 mm). 
3. One in every 25 charging spaces, but not less than one, shall also have an 8- foot (2438 mm) wide 

minimum aisle. A 5-foot (1524 mm) wide minimum aisle shall be permitted provided the minimum 
width of the EV space is 12 feet (3658 mm). 

a. Surface slope for this EV space and the aisle shall not exceed 1 unit vertical in 48 units 
horizontal (2.083 percent slope) in any direction. 

Exception: Where the Town of San Anselmo Municipal Code permits parking space dimensions that are 
less than the minimum reguirements stated in this section 4.106.4.3.2. and the compliance with which 
would be infeasible due to particular circumstances of a project an exception may be granted while 
remaining in compliance with California Building Code ection Table 11 B-228.3.2.1 and 11 B-812. as 
applicable. 

13 

https://4.106.4.JH


DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

4.106.4.1.2.1.J Aeeessible EV speecs. In addition to the requirements ie Seetions 4 .106.4 .2.2.1.1 aAs 
4.106.4.2.2.1.2, all EV~H;, when installes, shal.l eomply with the accessibility provisions for eV el:largers 
in the Cslife,"1iia Building Cede, Chapter I IB. g\' ready spaces ans EVCS in multifamily de>.'eJepments 
sllall comply with Califo,•-nie Buikiiwg Cede Chapt:er 11 A, Seetion 1109A. 

4.106.4.4 Direct current fast charging stations (DCFC}. One DCFC mav be substituted for up to five (5) EVCS 
to meet the requirements of 4.106.4.1 and 4.106.4.2. Where ALMS serve DCFC stations, the power demand from 
the DCFC shall be prioritized above Level 1 and Level 2 spaces. 

4.l0li.4.2.J EV speee requirements. 
1. Single EV spaee required. lnstaU a listed raeeway eapable efaeeornrnesating a 208/240 ¥olt desieated 
eranel~ eireuft. Tl:le raeeway s·haH not ee less than lrase siz:e I (nominal I iReA iRside Elia.meter). The 
raeeway skall originate at ~e main serYiee or suepanel and shall tern:1inate into a listes eabinet, aeic er 
enelesu.re iR close proximity to the loeatioR er tke pro13esed loeation of U=ie EV space. Construction 
eoeuments sl:lall identify the raceway termiAatioA point, reeeptaele or eharger loeatioa, as applieable. The 
seFYice panel a.Acl,lor subpaAel shall l<lave a 40 ampere miAi-murn eedieatee eraneh eireuit, ineludiflg 
braAeh eireuit O\'eret.trrent preteet:ive eevice install eel or spaee(s) reser¥es to permit iAStallatioA of a 
eraneh eire1:1it o¥eret.trrent proteeti·,ie de:viee. 

E~eeptiee: A raeeway is not reEJuiree if a tflinirnum 40 am.pore 208/240 volt eeeieated EV brancl:~ ci:t=cuit 
is installed iA close prox.imity to the leeation or the proposed location of the EV spaee, at the time of 
original eonswuetien iA aecordance with the Califomi-a EkeMeBl Code. 

L Multiple EV spaees requireEI . GoAstruetioo doc1:HneAts skall indieate the raceway termiAatioo peiAl 
and the loeation of iAsmlled er fl:lt1:1re EV spaees reeeptaeles or EV ehargers. Construetion 
Elocuments shall also provide informatioA en amperage of installed er ftiture reoeptaeles or EVS6 
raceway method(s), wiring schematics and eleotrieal load ealoulatieAs. Plan desigA shall ee eased 
u130F1 a 40 ampere minimum braneh circuit. RequireEI raee•Nays and related components tRat are 
13lannee to ee iB:Stalled uedergrounEI eeelosed, iaaeeessiale or in eoneealed areas aAd spaces shall be 
i:Astalles at the time of origiaal coestructioR. 

E:iteeptiee: A raeeway is not requires if a minimum 40 ampere 2081240 volt dedicated eV branch eirG1:1it 
is installed in close prox.imity to the locatioA or tee proposed loeatien efthe EV spaee at tl:te time of 
original eoRstruetion in aecordaRce with the Califemi<:1 Eleetrical Cede. 

4.106.4.2.4 ldeetif!iealien. 
The service panel or subpanel oireuit direotol)' shall identify the overaurrent proteeti,,e device space(s) 
reser.,•ed for ~ure 13V el:larging purposes as 'eV GAP,'\..BbE" i:A aeeerdance with the Ca{ifo,1·l'lia 
Eleeh•i:fJ8l Cede. 

4.106.4.2.5 Eledric Vehiele Reedy Speee Signege. 
Bleetric ¥eh isle reacly spaces shall ee identifies by signage or pa.,•effient markings, in oemplianee witA 
Ca:ltrans Traffie Operations Polioy Directive 13 01 (Zero Emission Vel:l~ole Signs and P8:\10ffleet 
Markings) or its sueeessor(s). 
4.l0li.4.3 Electric ,·ebielc ehergieg for additions end elteretiens of perking feeilities serving existing 
multilomil,• lrnildi:Bgs. 
Wben eew 13arkit1g facilities are added or eleetrieal systems or lighting ofmtist:iAg 13arlciAg facilities are 
adEled or altereel aAd the work requ-ires a building permit:, ten (10) pereent of the total AUffiaer of parking 
spaces added or alt:ered, sl:lall ae eleotrie ,•ehicle charging spaces (13V spaees) eapable of supporting future 
Level 2 EVSE. 
~ 

I. CoAst=ruotion documents are intended to semoAstrate tee project s capability and capaeity for 
faeilitating future EV eharging. 

14 

https://enelesu.re


DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

2. There is no req1:1irement for BY spaces to be constrnete.d or avaUable until EV chargers are installed 
for \:IS@. 

Section A4. l 06.8 of the 2022 CALGreen Code is hereby amended as underlined and struck through: 

New construction shall comply with Sections A4.106.8. l , AU 06.8.2 or A4. I06.&.3, to facilitate future 
installation and use of electric vehicle chargers. Electric vehicle supply equipment (EVSE) shall be 
installed in accordance with the California Electrical Code, Article 625. 

Section A4.106.9.2 of the 2022 CALGreen Code is hereby included as a requirement for new Multifamily 
Buildings. 

facilities shall be conveniently reached from the street and may include. but not be limited to: 
I. Covered, lockable enclosures with permanently anchored racks for bicycles. 
2. Lockable bicycle rooms with permanently anchored racks. 
3. Lockable, permanently anchored bicycle lockers. 

Section 5.106.5.3 of the 2022 CALGreen Code is hereby amended as underlined and struck through: 
5.106.5.3 Electric vehicle (EV) charging. 
fNt Construction to provide electric vehicle infrastructure and facilitate electric vehicle charging shall 
comply with Section 5.106.5.3.1 and shall be provided in accordance with regulations in the California 
Building Code and the California Electrical Code. Accessible EVCS shall be provided in accordance with 
the California Building Code Chapter 11 B Section 11 B-228.3. For EVCS signs, refer to Caltrans Traffic 
Operations Policy Directive 13-01 (Zero Emission Vehicle igns and Pavement Markings) or its 
successor(s). Calculation for spaces shall be rounded up to the nearest whole number. 

Exceptions: 
1. On a case-by-case basis, where the local enforcing agency has determined EV charging and 

infrastructure are not feasible based upon one or more of the following conditions: 
a. Where there is no local utility power supply 
b. Where the local utility is unable to supply adequate power. 
c. Where there is evidence suitable to the local enforcement agency substantiating that 

additional local utility infrastructure design requirements, directly related to the 
implementation of Section 5.106.5.3, may adversely impact the construction cost of the 
project. 

2. Parking spaces accessible only by automated mechanical car parking systems are not required to 
comply with this code section. 

Section AS.106.5 of Appendix AS of the 2022 CALGreen Code is hereby amended as struck through: 

AS.106.5,l Desigeated peFldng fer clean air 'l'Chieles. 
In new pre:ieets or aaditioas or altemtions that add !O OF more ,·ehie1:1lar parking spaees, pro,.·iae 
desig11ated parking for any eombination of ~ere emitting, fuel effieient and earpool/¥an pool ¥ehieles as 
listed in code Seetions A5.10e.5.I.I or AS.106.5.1.2. 

AS.106.1.1,1 Tier 1. 
Pro•lide 35 percent designated parking spaces of the total r1:1:1mber of parking spaces, for any eombinalion 
ohero emitting, fl:lel effisient a-Rd earpeol/•tan pool ·tehieles. Caleulation for spaees sl=tall be reHnaed 1:1p 
to the whole n1:1mber. 

15 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

Note: Designated parking for clean air vehioles shall oount toward the total parlc.iRg spaces required by the 
local enforciRg agencies. 

AS.106.1.1.2 TieF 2. 
Provide 50 13eroont designated 13arking spaces of the total n*mber of parking s13aces for any combination 
of z.ero emitting, fuel efficient and carpool/van pool vehicles. Caloulation fur spaoes shall be rounded up 
to the whole n1:1mber. 
Note: Designates 13ark,ieg for eleae air ,,,ehioles shall count tawarEI the total parkiRg spaces requi:rea ey the 
local enfurciRg agencies. 

AS,Olt.S,1,3 ParlHRg stall marking. 
Paint in the paint for stall strif)ing, the following characters sueh that the lower edge of the last wore 
a:ligns witl=t the end ofthe stal l sti=i13ing afld is ,1isiele eeBeath a 13arh:ed >,·ehiele: 
CLEAN AIR/ 
VA~l'POOL/EV 
Note: Vehieles bearing Clean Air Vehicle stickers from eKpired HOV lane 13rograms may ee coAsidered 
eligiele fer aesigriated parkiRg s13aees. 

l ..S.lOlt.S.l.l Vehiele desigeetioes. 
Bl-Ii leling maR.agers may const-1lt with loea:I Transit Manageffient Associations (TM As) for methods of 
designating qt-1alifyiRg vehieles, such as issuing parking stie~ers. 
Natest 

1. Information on q1:1a:lifying yeJ:iicles ear laeeliAg reg1:1lati.0Rs a:rid DMV CAY aeeals 
ffl&y ee obtaiAeEI froffl tl:le followi:rlg souFees: 
a. California Dri>.•eCleaA. 
b. California Air Resources Board. 
C. us EPA fuel 0C0flOFF1Y reg1:,1latiefis aAel SffiAdarEis. 
El. OMV Registration Operatioes. 

2. Pu:rshasi.Bg polis~· aHd refueli,~g sites fer 2'ieE0 e:rnitting ·,ehieles :for state emplo~·ees HS@ 

ean be fo1:,1nel at the DepartmeRt of GeAeral Ser'lices. 

AS.106.Y Electric Vehicle (EV) charging. {NJ 
Construction shall comply with Section AS.106.5.3 .1 or AS .106.5.3 .2, and in accordance with regulations in the 
California Building Code and the California Electrical Code. Accessible EVCS shall be provided in accordance 
with the California Building Code Chapter 11B Section 11B-228.3. For EVCS signs. refer to Caltrans Traffic 
Operations Policy Directive 13-0 l (Zero Emission Vehicle Signs and Pavement Markings) or its successor(s). 
Calculation for spaces shall be rounded up to the nearest whole number. 

Exceptions: 
1. On a case-by-case basis where the local enforcing agency has determined compliance with this section is not 
feasible based upon one of the following conditions: 

a. Where there is no local utility power supply. 
b. Where the Local utility is unable to supply adequate power. 
c. Where there is evidence suitable to the local enforcement agency substantiating that additional local 
utility infrastructure design requirements. directly related to the implementation of Section AS.106.5. may 
adversely impact the construction cost of the project. 

2. Parking spaces accessible only by automated mechanical car parking systems are not required to comply with 
this code section. 

AS.106.5.3 Nonresidential Occupancies - Shared Parking Facilities. 
AS.106.5.3.1 New Construction - Tier 1. 

16 

https://Pu:rshasi.Bg


DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

Table A5.106.5.3.1 shall be used to determine the number of EV capable spaces required. Refer to section 
5.106.5.3 for design space requirements. 
When EV capable spaces are provided with EVSE to create EVCS per Table A5.106.5.3.1. 

TABLE AS.106.5.3.1 

TOTAL 
NUMBER OF 

ACTUAL 
PARKING 
SPACES 

TIER 1 
NUMBER OF REQUIRED 
EV CAPABLE SPACES 

TIER 1 
NUMBER OF EVCS 

(EV CAPABLE 
SPACES PROVIDED 

WITH EVSE) 2 

0-9 2 0 
10-25 5 0 

26-50 11 2 

51-75 19 3 

76-100 26 4 

101-150 38 6 

151-200 53 9 

201 and over 30 percent of tota11 25 percent of EV 
capable spaces 1 

1. Calculation for spaces shall be rounded up to the nearest whole number. 
2. The number of required EVCS (EV capable spaces provided with EVSE) in column 3 count 
toward the total number ofrequired EV capable spaces shown in column 2. 

AS.106.5.3.2 Additions and alterations of existing buildings +iet'--2-a-
1. When parking facilities upgrade the service panel or parking lot surface is modified, including the 

removal of paving material and curbing, comply with the number of spaces designated for the 
project type as outlined in Table I of Section 9-19.050 of tbe San Anselmo Municipal Code. 
Upgrades shall be required at currently designated vehicl.e parking spaces. Upgrades shall be 
required for remaining parking spaces after meeting the accessibility requirements of California 
Building Code Chapters 11A and 11B. 

2. When new parking facil ities are added and ALMS is installed, the ALMS system must be 
designed to deliver no less than 2.2 kVa (1 10/120 volt. 20-ampere). 

AS.106.5.4 Direct cu.rrent fast charging stations. One DCFC may be substituted for up to five (5) EVCS to 
meet the requirements of 5.106.5.3 . Where ALMS serve DCF'C stations, the power demand from the DCF'C shall 
be prioritized above Level 1 and Level 2 spaces. 

Taele AS. 106.5.3.2 shall ee used to determine the numeer of EV capable spaees required. Refer to seetioA 
5.106.5.3 for design space requirements. 
When BV ca13aele spaces fife pro.,·ided with E'/86 to ereate eVCS per Taele AS.106.5.3. 1, refer to 
Seetioa 5.106.5.3.2 for t;l:ie allewed use ef Le•;el 2 or Direct Current Fast Gkarger (DCFC) and Section 
5.106.5.3.3 for the alle•.Yed use of Automatic Load Management Systems (ALMS). 

TABLE AS.106.S.3.2 

17 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

TOTAL 
NYM8ER QF 

TIER2 
NYM8ER OF REQYIRED 

TIER2 
NYMBER OF EVGS 

AGTYAL EV GAPA8LE SPACES {EV GAPA8LE 
SPACES PROVIDED PARKING 

SPACES 111,IITU C\/~ C\ 2 ---- -- --, 
Q-S a Q 
~ g a 
20 aQ 4-7 e 
&t--7-e 28 g 

7e ~QQ 4Q 4a 

~Q~ ~aQ a-7 48 

~ a~ 2QQ 78 ~ 

2Q~ aRa evei: 4a J:)eFseRt ef tetal.:i. J3 13eFseRt ef e}J 
~--.--L...J- - - -1--·r 

-h 

Calculation for spaces shall ee rouneied 1:1p to the nearest y;hele A\:lmeer. 
2. Tl'le n~1meer of req~1ireei BVCS (eV capable s1=1aees 1=1re,..ieieei witk 6VSBj in column 3 count 

towarei tke total numeer of requires EV ea1=1able s1=1aees shown in eolumn 2. 

Section 5.106.5.4 ofthe 2022 CALGreen Code is hereby amended as struck through: 

5.106.5.4 Electric vehicle (E¥)-charging readiness: medium-duty and heavy-duty. [NJ 
Construction shall comply with Section 5.106.5.4.1 to facilitate future installation of electric vehicle supply 
equipment (EVSE). Construction for warehouses, grocery stores and retail stores with planned off-street loading 
spaces shall also comply with Section 5.106.5.4.1 for future installation ofmedium- and heavy-duty EVSE. 
Accessible EVCS shall be provided in accordance with the California Building Code Chapter 11 B Section I JB-
228.3. For EVCS signs, refer to Caltrans Traffic Operations Policy Directive 13-01 (Zero Emission Vehicle Signs 
and Pavement Markings) or its successor(s). 

Exceptions: 
I. On a case-by-case basis where the local enforcing agency has determined compliance with this section is not 
feasible based upon one of the following conditions: 

a. Where there is no local utility power supply. 
b. Where the local utility is unable to supply adequate power. 
c. Where there is evidence suitable to the local enforcing agency substantiating that additional local utility 
infrastructure design requirements, directly related to the implementation of Section 5.106.5.3, may 
adversely impact the construction cost of the project. 

\l/1'-len EVCS(s) are installed it sl'laH be in aeeordaAee vt'ith lhe Cmifomie Buil6'iRg Cede ~e CeU-fem'lie 
Eleo,~·ieal Cede as follows: 

5.106.5.4.1 Eleett'ie ,·ehiele eluugieg Feadieess Fequil'ements fel' w Warehouses, grocery stores and retail 
stores with planned off-street loading spaces. 
[N] In order to avoid future demolition when adding EV supply and distribution equipment, spare raceway(s) or 
busway(s) and adequate capacity for transformer(s), service panel(s) or subpanel(s) shall be installed at the time 
of construction in accordance with the California Electrical Code. Construction plans and specifications shall 
include, but are not limited to, the following: 

18 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

1. The transformer, main service equipment and subpanels shall meet the minimum power requirement 
in Table 5.106.5.4.1 to accommodate the dedicated branch circuits for the future installation of 
EVSE. 

2. The construction documents shall indicate one or more location(s) convenient to the planned off
street loading space(s) reserved for medium- and heavy-duty ZEV charging cabinets and charging 
dispensers, and a pathway reserved for routing of conduit from the termination of the raceway(s) or 
busway(s) to the charging cabinet(s) and dispenser(s), as shown in Table 5.106.5.4.1. 

3. Raceway(s) or busway(s) originating at a main service panel or a subpanel(s) serving the area where 
potential future medium- and heavy-duty EVSE will be located and shall terminate in close 
proximity to the potential future location of the charging equipment for medium- and heavy-duty 
vehicles. 

4. The raceway( s) or bus way( s) shall be of sufficient size to carry the minimum additional system load 
to the future location of the charging for medium- and heavy-duty EVs as shown in Table 
5.106.5.4.1. 

TABLE 5.106.5.4.1, Raceway Conduit and Panel power Requirements for Medium-and-Heavy-Duty EVSE 
[NJ 

Building 
type 

Building Size 

(sq. ft.) 

Number of Off-
street loading 
spaces 

Additional capacity Required 
(kVa) for Raceway & 
Busway and Transformer & 
Panel 

Grocery 10,000 to 
90,000 

1 or 2 200 

3 or Greater 400 

Greater than 
90,000 

1 or Greater 400 

Retail 10,000 to 
135,000 

1 or 2 200 

3 or Greater 400 

Greater than 
135,000 

1 or Greater 400 

Warehouse 20,000 to 
256,000 

1 or 2 200 

3 or Greater 400 

Greater than 
256,000 

1 or Greater 400 

9-19.050 Standards for compliance. 

19 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

The San Anselmo Green Building Requirements define compliance thresholds for different projects that 
are covered by this ordinance. These standards are summarized below in Table 1. The energy efficiency and 
electrification measures menu and specifications are detailed in Tables 2 and 3. 

Table 1: Requirements by Project T,,pe and Size 
Project 
Type 

and Size 

Green Building 
Requirements 

Energy Efficiency 
Requirements 

Electric 
Vehicle 

Requirements 
Single and Two-
Family New 
Construction 

CALGreen Tier 1 Meet the standards 
outlined for the 
project in the 2022 
California Energy 
Code 

Comply with CALGreen Measure 
A4.106.8.1, Tier 1 

Multifamily CALGreen Tier 1 Of the total parking spaces, 
Residential (i) 15% Level 2 (L2) EVCS 
New Construction Install long-term bike 

parking per 
CALGreen 
A4.106.9.2, as 
modified bl Section 
9-19.040 

(ii) 85% Low-Power Level 2 (LPL2) EV 
Ready 

Non residential CALGreen Tier 1 Meet the standards For Nonresidential: comply with 
New Construction outlined for the 

project in the 2022 
California Energy 
Code 

CALGreen Measure A5.106.5.3.1, Tier 
1-
' 

AND 

For Nonresidential Grocery, Retail, or 
Warehouses planning off-street 
medium-heavy-duty loading spaces: 
comply with CALGreen Measure 
5.106.5.4 

Single and Two- CALGreen Mandatory Meet the standards If the project is upgrading the main 
Family Additions outlined for the electrical service panel, comply with 
and Alterations Conductor ready project in the 2022 CALGreen Measure A4.106.8.1, Tier 1 
less than 750 required for laundry California Energy 
square feet room and kitchen 

remodels 
regardless of 
remodel size. 

Code 

20 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

Table 1: Requirements by Project Tvpe and Size 
Project 
Type 

and Size 

Green Building 
Requirements 

Energy Efficiency 
Requirements 

Electric 
Vehicle 

Reauirements 
Single and Two- CALGreen Tier 1 Using the Measure If the project is upgrading the main 
Family Additions Menu in Table 2, electrical service panel, comply with 
and Alterations achieve a total score CALGreen Measure A4.106.8.1, Tier 1 
750 square feet that is equal to or 
or greater; and greater than the 
Substantial Target Score for the 
Improvements applicable climate 

zone and install the 
electric readiness 
measures (ER2) as 
aoolicable in Table 3 

Multifamily 
Residential 
Additions and 
Alterations less 
than 750 square 
feet 

CALGreen Mandatory 

Conductor ready 
required for laundry 
room and kitchen 
remodels 
regardless of 
remodel size. 

Meet the standards 
outlined for the 
project in the 2022 
California Energy 
Code 

If the service panel is modified, add 
designated electrical capacity for 20% 
of onsite parking spaces to be Level 2 
EV Ready. 

If parking lot surface is modified (paving 
material and curbing removed): 
(i) add raceway to a minimum of 50% 

of exposed parking spaces, OR 
(ii) add raceway to a minimum of 20% 

of exposed parking spaces and 
install at minimum 5% EVCS to 
parking spaces requiring any 
combination of Level 2 and Direct 
Current Fast Charging EVSE, 
except at least one Level 2 EVSE 
shall be provided. 

Where existing electrical service will not 

Multifamily 
Residential 
Additions and 
Alterations 750 
square feet or 
greater; and 
Substantial 
Improvements 

CALGreen Tier 1 

Nonresidential 
Additions and be upgraded in the existing project 
Alterations scope, designate capacity for parking 

spaces to the maximum extent that 
does not require an upgrade to existing 
electrical service. 

The following conditions also apply to Table 1: 
(a) Cumulative new construction or remodels during the preceding 36-month period from the acceptance of 

this application shall be considered as a single covered project, and subject to the highest compliance 
threshold based on the cumulative project size or valuation. 

(b) Mixed use (residential and commercial) projects must comply either with the applicable covered project 
requirements for the respective residential and commercial portions of the project or may propose to 
utilize a mixed-use rating system, subject to approval by the chief building official. 

The following are exceptions to Table 1: 

21 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

(1) Where the requirements of Tier 1 are infeasible as a result of the market, economy, or technology 
available as determined by the chief building official (CBO), the CBO may provide an alternative or waive the 
requirement. 

Table 2: Energy and Electrification Menu of Measures by Climate Zone 

Measure 
Climate Zone Steps 

2 
1) Choose your Climate Zone using CEC 
toolfinder1 

Specification 

Spec. ID 
(Refer to 
Table 3) 

Taraet Score 2) Minimum Target Score needed to 
comply 
(1 point = 1 MM BTU savings per yr.)8 

Lighting E1 Mandatory 3) Choose a measure or a combination 
of measures that adds up to the 
minimum target score above based on 
CZ. Measures listed as "Mandatory" 
MUST be installed. 

4) Use the Specification Number (Spec. 
ID) column as a key and conform to the 
specifications in Table 3 below. Table 3 
describes, specifies, and details 
compliance with each corresponding 
measure. 

Water Heating 
Package 

E2 1 

Air Sealing E3 1 

R-49 Attic 
Insulation 

E4 1 

Duct Sealing E5 1 

New Ducts+ 
Duct Sealing 

E6 2 

PV + Electric 
Ready Pre-

Wire 
ER1 12 

Electric 
Readiness 
Measures 

ER2 
Mandatory 

(if remodeling kitchen, 
laundry, or upgrading panel) 

HPWH FS1 12 

High Eff 
HPWH 

FS2 13 

HVAC Heat 
Pump 

FS3 13 

High Eff HVAC 
Heat Pump FS4 14 

Heat Pump 
Clothes Dryer FS5 1 

Induction 
Cooktop FS6 1 

1California Energy Commission climate zone tool finder at https://www.energy.ca.gov/programs-and-
topics/Qrograms/building-energy-efficiency-standards/climate-zone-tool-maps-and. 

The following conditions also apply to Table 2: 

22 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

(a) Unless otherwise specified, the requirements shall apply to the entire dwelling unit, not just the 
additional or altered portion. 
(b) Measures from the Measure Menu in Table 2 and specified in Table 3, that already exist in the home, 
may be counted towards compliance with these requirements, unless otherwise specified in Table 3. 
(c) Measures from the Measure Menu in Table 2 that are to be installed to satisfy requirements under the 
State Energy Code, Title 24, Part 6, may also be counted towards compliance with these requirements. 
Where these requirements conflict with other Energy Code requirements, the stricter requirements shall 
prevail. 

Table 3. List of Measure Specifications 

ID Measure Specification 

Energy Measures 

E1 Lighting Measures - Replace all interior and exterior screw-in incandescent, halogen, 
and compact fluorescent lamps with LED lamps. Install photocell controls on all exterior 
lighting luminaires. 

E2 Water Heating Package: Add exterior insulation meeting a minimum of R-6 to existing 
storage water heaters. Insulate all accessible hot water pipes with pipe insulation a 
minimum of¾ inch thick. This includes insulating the supply pipe leaving the water 
heater, piping to faucets underneath sinks, and accessible pipes in attic spaces or 
crawlspaces. Upgrade fittings in sinks and showers to meet current California Green 
Building Standards Code (Title 24, Part 11) Section 4.303 water efficiency requirements. 

Exception 1: Water heater blanket is not required on water heaters less than 20 
gallons. 

Exception 2: .Water heater blanket not required if application of a water heater 
blanket voids the warranty on the water heater. 

Exception 3: Upgraded fixtures are not required if existing fixtures have rated or 
measured flow rates of no more than ten percent greater than 2022 
California Green Building Standards Code (Title 24, Part 11) Section 
4.303 water efficiency requirements. 

Exception 4: Water heaters with factory installed insulation of R-24 or greater 

E3 Air Sealing: Seal all accessible cracks, holes, and gaps in the building envelope at walls, 
floors, and ceilings. Pay special attention to penetrations including plumbing, electrical, 
and mechanical vents, recessed can light luminaires, and windows. Weather-strip doors 
if not already present. Verification shall be conducted following a prescriptive checklist 
that outlines which building aspects need to be addressed by the permit applicant and 
verified by an inspector. Compliance can also be demonstrated with blower door testing 
conducted by a certified HERS Rater no more than three years prior to the permit 
application date that either: a) shows at least a 30 percent reduction from pre-retrofit 
conditions; or b) shows that the number of air changes per hour at 50 Pascals pressure 
difference (ACH50) does not exceed ten. If combustion appliances are located within the 
pressure boundary of the building, conduct a combustion safety test by a professional 
certified by the Building Performance Institute in accordance with the ANSI/BPl-1200-S-
2017 Standard Practice for Basic Analysis of Buildings\ the Whole House Combustion 
Appliance Safety Test Procedure for the Comfortable Home Rebates Program 2020 or 
the California Community Services and Development Combustion Appliance Safety 
Testing Protocol. 

E4 

~ ----~ 

R-49 Attic Insulation: Attic insulation shall be installed to achieve a weighted assembly 
U-factor of 0.020 or insulation installed at the ceiling level shall have a thermal 
resistance of R-49 or greater for the insulation alone. Recessed downlight luminaires in 

23 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

the ceiling shall be covered with insulation to the same depth as the rest of the ceiling. 
Luminaires not rated for insulation contact must be replaced or fitted with a fire-proof 
cover that allows for insulation to be installed directly over the cover. 

Exception: In buildings where existing R-30 is present and existing recessed 
downlight luminaires are not rated for insulation contact, insulation is 
not required to be installed over the luminaires. 

E5 Duct Sealing: Air seal all space conditioning ductwork to meet the requirements of the 
2022 Title 24 Section 150.2(b) 1 E. The duct system must be tested by a HERS Rater no 
more than three years prior to the Covered Single Family Project permit application date 
to verify the duct sealing and confirm that the requirements have been met. This 
measure may not be combined with the New Ducts and Duct Sealing measure in this 
Table. 

E6 New Ducts + Duct Sealing: Replace existing space conditioning ductwork with new R-8 
ducts that meet the requirements of 2022 Title 24 Section 150.0(m)11. This measure 
may not be combined with the Duct Sealing measure in this Table. To qualify, a 
preexisting measure must have been installed no more than three years before the 
Covered SinQle Family Project permit application date. 

E7 Windows: Replace all existing windows with high performance windows with an area-
weighted averaQe U-factor no greater than 0.32. 

EB R-13 Wall Insulation: Install wall insulation in all exterior walls to achieve a weighted U-
factor of 0.102 or install wall insulation in all exterior wall cavities that shall result in an 
installed thermal resistance of R-13 or Qreater for the insulation alone. 

Fuel Substitution Measures 

FS1 Heat Pump Water Heater (HPWH): Replace all existing electric resistance and natural 
gas storage water heaters with heat pump water heaters. 

FS2 High Efficiency Heat Pump Water Heater (HPWH): Replace all existing electric 
resistance and natural gas storage water heaters with heat pump water heaters with a 
Northwest Energy Efficiency Alliance (NEEA) Tier 3 or higher rating. 

FS3 HVAC Heat Pump: Replace all existing gas space heating system and existing electric 
resistance heating systems with electric heat pump systems. 

FS4 High Efficiency HVAC Heat Pump: Replace all existing gas space heating system and 
existing electric resistance heating systems with electric heat pump systems with a 
SEER ratinQ of 21 or greater and an HSPF ratinQ of 11 or Qreater. 

FS5 Heat Pump Clothes Dryer: Replace all existing gas or electric resistance clothes dryers 
with heat pump dryers with no resistance element and cap the gas lines. 

FS6 Induction Cooktop: Replace all existing gas and electric resistance stove tops with 
inductive stove tops and cap the gas lines. 

Solar PV and Electric-Readiness Measures 

ER1 PV+ Electric Ready Pre-Wire: 
For New PV Systems: Install a new solar PV system that meets the requirements of 
2022 Title 24 Section 150.1 ( c) 14 and upgrade the service panel to meet the 
requirements of ER2.G. and install any two of the other measures from ER2.A - ER2.F. 

For Existing PV Systems: If the home already has an existing PV system, to claim credit 
for this measure, ER1, upgrade the service panel to meet the requirements of ER2.G. 

24 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

and install any two of the other measures from ER2.A - ER2.F. 

ER2 Electric Readiness Measures: 

To claim credit for Item ER1, in addition to the solar PV system installed, upgrade the 
panelboard to meet the requirements of Item ER2.G and install any two of the other 
measures ER2.A - ER2.F, below to allow for installation of electric appliances at a future 
date. 

For any Covered Project, if the service panel is being upgraded, install any two of the 
other measures below. 
If the laundry room is being remodeled, comply with Item ER2.D and upgrade the 
panelboard to meet the requirements of Item ER2.G. 

If the kitchen is being remodeled, comply with Item ER2.C and upgrade the service 
panel to meet the requirements of Item ER2.G. 

A. Heat Pump Water Heater Ready, as specified in Section 150.0(n)1. 

B. Heat Pump Space Heater Ready, as specified in Section 150.0(t). 

C. Electric Cooktop Ready, as specified in Section 150.0(u). 

D. Electric Clothes Dryer Ready, as specified in Section 150.0(v). 

E. Energy Storage Systems (ESS) Ready, as specified in Section 150.0(s). 

F. EV Charger Ready. Install a listed raceway for an EV charger, that meets the 
requirements of the California Green Building Standards Code (Title 24, Part 11) 
Section A4.106.8.1, Tier 1 and 2, which otherwise applies to new construction. 

G. Upgrade the panelboard serving the individual dwelling to either: 

(i) a minimum 200 amp panel with a minimum 225 amp busbar rating to 
accommodate future connection of electric appliances, including heat pump 
water heaters, heat pump space heaters, electric cooktops, electric clothes 
dryers as specified in California Energy Code Section 150.0 (n), (t), (u) and 
(v) and Level 2 electric vehicle supply equipment; or, 

(ii) provide electrical load calculations and appliance specifications for serving 
all of these end-uses with a minimum 100-amp panel. 

Exception: If an electrical permit is not otherwise required for the project 
other than compliance with this Item, ER2. 

9-19.060 Incentives for compliance. 
In addition to the required standards for compliance, the Town Council may establish by resolution, 

financial or application processing incentives and/or award or recognition programs to encourage higher levels of 
green building compliance for a project. 

9-19.070 Administrative procedures. 

The procedures for compliance with the provisions of this chapter shall include, but not be limited to the 
following: 

(a) Project design. Applicants for a covered project are strongly encouraged to involve a qualified 
green building rater in the initial design phases of the project in advance of submittal of an 

25 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

application to determine applicable green building compliance thresholds and the most cost 
effective and appropriate means of achieving compliance. 

(b) Planning applications. If a discretionary planning application is required for a covered project, 
applicants should be prepared to identify expected green building measures to be included in the 
project to achieve the compliance thresholds. Applicants should identify any anticipated 
difficulties in achieving compliance and any exemptions from the requirements of this chapter 
that may be requested. 

(c) Building plan check review. Upon submittal of an application for a building permit, building 
plans for any covered project shall include a green building program description and completed 
checklist. The checklist shall be incorporated onto a separate full-sized plan sheet included with 
the building plans. Evidence that the project, as indicated by the project plans and green building 
program description, will achieve the standards for compliance outlined in Section 9-19.050 shall 
be provided prior to issuance of a building permit. 

(d) Changes during construction. During the construction process, alternate green building measures 
may be substituted, provided that documentation of the proposed change and the project's 
continued ability to achieve the standards for compliance to the chief building official shall be 
provided. 

(e) Final building inspection. Prior to final building inspection and occupancy for any covered 
project, evidence that project construction has achieved the required compliance set forth in the 
standards for compliance outlined in Section 9-19.050 shall be provided. The chief building 
official shall review the documentation submitted by the applicant and determine whether the 
project has achieved the compliance threshold as set forth in the standards for compliance 
outlined in Section 19.04.140. If the chief building official determines that the applicant has met 
these requirements, the final building inspection may proceed. 

(f) Conflict with other laws. The provisions of this chapter are intended to be in addition to and not 
in conflict with other laws, regulations and ordinances relating to building construction and site 
development. If any provision of this chapter conflicts with any duly adopted and valid statutes or 
regulations of the federal government or the state of California, the federal or state statutes or 
regulations shall take precedence. 

19.04.170 Exemptions. 
(a) The provisions of this chapter shall not apply to: 

(1) Buildings which are temporary (such as construction trailers). 
(2) Building area which is not or is not intended to be conditioned space. 
(3) Any requirements of this chapter which would impair the historic integrity of any 

building listed on a local, state or federal register of historic structures, as determined by 
the chief building official and as regulated by the California Historic Building Code 
(Title 24, Part 8). In making such a determination, the chief building official may require 
the submittal of an evaluation by an architectural historian or similar expert. 

(b) As outlined in the 2022 CALGreen code, section 4.106.4 and A5.106.5, applicants may be 
exempted from the electric vehicle changing requirements on a case-by-case basis where the local 
enforcing agency has determined EV charging and infrastructure are not feasible based upon one 
or more of the following conditions: 
(1) Where there is no commercial power supply or the local utility is unable to supply 

adequate power. 
(2) Where there is evidence suitable to the local enforcing agency substantiating that 

additional local utility infrastructure design requirements, directly related to the 
implementation of section 4.106.4 and A5. l 06.5 may adversely impact the construction 
cost of the project. 

(3) ADUs and JADUs without additional parking facilities. 

26 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

(4) Parking spaces accessible only by automated mechanical car parking systems are not 
required to comply with CALGreen Code section 4.106.4 and AS. I 06.5 

(c) Hardship or infeasibility exemption. If an applicant for a covered project believes that 
circumstances exist that make it a hardship or infeasible to meet the requirements of this chapter, 
the applicant may request an exemption as set forth below. In applying for an exemption, the 
burden is on the applicant to show hardship or infeasibility. 
(1) Application. Based on the following, the applicant shall identify in writing the specific 

requirements of the standards for compliance that the project is unable to achieve and the 
circumstances that make it a hardship or infeasible for the project to comply with this 
chapter. The applicant may not petition for relief from any requirement of the 2022 
California Energy Code (Title 24, Part 6) and referenced standards, or the 2022 
California Green Building Standards (Title 24, Part 11) of the California Building 
Standards Code. Circumstances that constitute hardship or infeasibility shall include one 
of the following: 
a. That the cost of achieving compliance is disproportionate to the overall cost of 

the project; 
b. That strict compliance with these standards would create or maintain a hazardous 

condition(s) and present a life safety risk to the occupants. 
(2) Granting ofexemption. If the chief building official determines that it is a hardship or 

infeasible for the applicant to fully meet the requirements of this chapter and that granting 
the requested exemption will not cause the building to fail to comply with the 2022 
California Energy Code (Title 24, Part 6) and referenced standards, or the 2022 
California Green Building Standards (Title 24, Part 11) of the California Building 
Standards Code, the chief building official shall determine the maximum feasible 
threshold of compliance reasonably achievable for the project. In making this 
determination, the chief building official shall consider whether alternate, practical means 
of achieving the objectives of this chapter can be satisfied, such as reducing comparable 
energy use at an off-site location within the county. If an exemption is granted, the 
applicant shall be required to comply with this chapter in all other respects and shall be 
required to achieve the threshold of compliance determined to be achievable by the chief 
building official. 

(3) Denial ofexception. If the chief building official determines that it is reasonably possible 
for the applicant to fully meet the requirements of this chapter, the request shall be 
denied, and the applicant shall be notified of the decision in writing. The project and 
compliance documentation shall be modified to comply with the standards for 
compliance. 

(4) Appeal. Any aggrieved applicant or person may appeal the determination of the chief 
building official regarding the granting or denial of an exemption or compliance with any 
other provision of this chapter. An appeal of a determination of the chief building official 
shall be filed in writing and processed in accordance with the provisions of Section 10-
1.06 of this code. 

(4) Appeal. Any aggrieved applicant or person may appeal the determination of the chief building 
official regarding the granting or denial of an exemption or compliance with any other provision of 
this chapter. An appeal of a determination of the chief building official shall be filed in writing and 
processed in accordance with the provisions of Section 10-1.06 of the San Anselmo Municipal Code. 

SECTION 5. Severability. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance is, 
for any reason, held to be unconstitutional or unlawful, such decision shall not affect the validity of the 
remaining portions of this ordinance. The Town Council hereby declares that it would have passed this 

27 



DocuSign Envelope ID: 256F2394-999A-4304-815E-2EF49E527BC7 

ordinance, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more 
sections, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional or unlawful. 

SECTION 6. Effective Date. This ordinance shall take effect and be in force thirty (30) days after the 
date of its passage, provided that the additional energy efficiency requirements of this Ordinance cannot be 
enforced by the Town until it has further been approved by the California Energy Commission (Cal. Pub. Res. 
Code §25402. l(h)(2)). Within fifteen (15) days following its passage, the ordinance shall be published with 
the names of those Town Council members voting for and against the ordinance and the Town Clerk shall 
post in the office of the town clerk a certified copy of the full text of the adopted ordinance along with the 
names of the members voting for and against the ordinance. Prior to the effective date, a copy of this 
Ordinance shall be filed with the California Building Standards Commission complete with local findings for 
each local amendment to the California Building Standards Code, as required by Cal. Health and Safety § 
17959. 

The foregoing ordinance was introduced at a regular meeting of the San Anselmo Town Council on the 
22nd day of August, 2023 and was adopted at a regular meeting on the 12th day of September, 2023 by the 
following vote: 

AYES COUNCILMEMBER: Kullaway, Fineman, Colbert, Mayor Burdo 

NOES COUNCILMEMBER: None 

ABSENT COUNCILMEMBER: None 

ABSTAIN COUNCILMEMBER: Vice Mayor Burke 

OocuSlgned by: 

GSfwt- tw-M 

ATTEST 

OocuSlgocd by: 

St-r~ Uw1A,,Q 

28 


	Structure Bookmarks
	Figure
	G




