

DOCKETED	
Docket Number:	24-OPT-05
Project Title:	Corby Battery Energy Storage System Project
TN #:	261972
Document Title:	County of Solano REVISED Request for Reimbursement Pursuant to Public Resources Code Section 25538
Description:	Revised Request for Reimbursement
Filer:	Erik Hagstrom
Organization:	County of Solano
Submitter Role:	Public Agency
Submission Date:	2/25/2025 3:11:58 PM
Docketed Date:	2/25/2025

DEPARTMENT OF RESOURCE MANAGEMENT

JAMES BEZEK
Director
(707) 784-6062



675 Texas Street, Suite 5500
Fairfield, CA 94533-6342
(707) 784-6765
Fax (707) 784-4805

www.solanocounty.com

Via Email and e-filing Docket 24-OPT-05

Renee Longman
Project Manager
California Energy Commission
715 P Street
Sacramento, CA 95814
Renee.longman@energy.ca.gov

Re: Docket 24-OPT-05: County of Solano REVISED Request for Reimbursement Pursuant to Public Resources Code Section 25538

Dear Ms. Longman:

On December 4, 2024, the County of Solano (“County”) submitted a Reimbursement Request for the actual and proposed costs associated with its review of and comments on the Corby Battery Energy Storage System Project Opt-in Application (“Application”). On December 18, 2024, the County received the California Energy Commission’s (“CEC”) response to its Reimbursement Request, which notified the County that its request was incomplete. The County hereby submits this Revised Request for Reimbursement to address the four incomplete items identified by the CEC:

1. The County inadvertently neglected to provide the applicant with a copy of its December 4, 2024, Reimbursement Request. The County is filing this Revised Reimbursement Request with both the CEC and the applicant, Corby Energy Storage, LLC.
2. The proposed budget in “Attachment A – Revised” is updated to further justify each line-item amount with an explanation of how each line-item is reasonably related to the matters that CEC requested County input pursuant to Public Resources Code section 25517(f) and California Code of Regulations, title 20, section 1877.
3. “Attachment A – Revised” is updated with additional detail for each line-item category. This includes, as requested, identifying the expenses included in the “Loss of Revenue from Permits/Development Impact Fees Not Received” by line-items in addition to the total amount for that category.
4. Attachment A – Revised is updated to remove (i) hours worked prior to the CEC’s receipt of the Application on November 7, 2024; (ii) hours worked prior to the request for information

SAEED IRAVANI
Building Official
Building & Safety

ALLAN CALDER
Program Manager
Planning Services

EDMOND STRICKLAND
Manager
Environmental Health

SARAH PAPPAKOSTAS
Administrative Services
Manager
Administrative Services

MATT TUGGLE
Engineering Manager
Public Works
Engineering

MATTHEW HARDY
Operations Manager
Public Works
Operations

CHRIS DRAKE
Parks Services
Manager
Parks

MISTY KALTREIDER
Water & Natural
Resources Program
Manager

Ms. Longman
February 11, 2025
Page 2 of 3

and comments on November 13, 2024; (iii) hours worked towards a county press release; and (iv) time related to the LUTC meeting on November 19, 2024.

The County appreciates the Commission's consideration of this revised request. If additional detail or justification is required related to items 2 and 3 above, please contact me so we can discuss exactly what the Commission is requesting. The County is committed to complying with all applicable laws and regulations in making its Reimbursement Request. We look forward to hearing from you.

Sincerely,



James Bezek
Director, Resource Management

Attachments:

- Attachment A - Revised: Corby BESS REVISED Reimbursable Costs Spreadsheet (January 16, 2025)
- Docket 24-OPT-05: County of Solano Request for Reimbursement Pursuant to Public Resources Code Section 25538 letter (December 4, 2024)

Attachment A - Revised

Reimbursable Costs Incurred To-Date and Projected under Public Resources Code section 25538

ATTACHMENT A

DEPARTMENT	NAME	FY24/25 FULLY WEIGHTED
Solano County Department of Resource Management	James Bezek	\$ 222.30
Solano County Department of Resource Management	Allan Calder	\$ 159.28
Solano County Department of Resource Management	Narcisa Untal	\$ 133.29
Solano County Department of Resource Management	Erik Hagstrom	\$ 82.86
Solano County Department of Resource Management	Misty Kaltreider	\$ 172.91
Solano County Department of Resource Management	Nedzlene Ferrario	\$ 143.39
Solano County Department of Resource Management	Matt Tuggle	\$ 183.84
Solano County Department of Resource Management	Peiman Mehrfar	\$ 151.85
Solano County Department of Agriculture	Ed King	\$ 195.00
Solano County Sheriff's Office	Robyn Rains	\$ 143.50
Solano County Administrator's Office	Debbie Vaughn	\$ 271.00
Solano County Administrator's Office	Emily Combs	\$ 238.56
Solano County Administrator's Office	Nancy Nelson	\$ 143.54
Solano County/County Counsel	Holly Tokar	\$ 126.00

APPLICATION ANALYSIS		COMMENT LETTER		
HOURS	COST	HOURS	COST	TOTAL
21.00	\$3,194.45	54.75	\$7,858.82	\$ 11,053.27

BUDGET FOR APPLICATION ANALYSIS	\$	3,194
BUDGET FOR COMMENT LETTER REIMBURSEMENT	\$	7,859
LOSS OF REVENUE FROM PERMITS/DEVELOPMENT IMPACT FEES NOT RECEIVED	\$	1,087,631
PUBLIC WORKS - GRADING PERMIT FEE	\$	17,917
PUBLIC WORKS - ENCROACHMENT PERMIT FEE	\$	20,795
PUBLIC WORKS - ROAD DAMAGE MITIGATION/BYRNES RD	\$	343,200
PUBLIC WORKS - ROAD DAMAGE MITIGATION/KILKENNY RD	\$	64,178
PUBLIC WORKS - ROAD DAMAGE MITIGATION/WEBER RD	\$	95,924
BUILDING - PLAN REVIEW FEE	\$	206,348
BUILDING - BUILDING PERMIT FEE	\$	317,459
BUILDING - BUILDING INSPECTION FEE	\$	17,800
BUILDING - STATE ADMINISTRATION FEE	\$	4,000
BUILDING - ARCHIVE FEE	\$	10
NET POSITIVE ECONOMIC BENEFIT ANALYSIS	\$	22,769.73
COMMUNITY BENEFITS PLAN & AGREEMENT	\$	2,210.7
DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION & OPERATION/PUBLIC NECESSITY/LORS OVERRIDE	\$	14,590.3
QUALIFYING CEQA REVIEW & COMMENT	\$	47,750.1
COSTS INCURRED TO DATE:	\$	11,053.3
PERMITS/DEVELOPMENT/IMPACT FEES:	\$	1,087,630.9
FORECASTED COSTS FOR CONTINUED REVIEW:	\$	87,320.8
GRAND TOTAL:	\$	1,098,684.2

"To apply for reimbursement, a local agency shall, within 21 days of receiving a request for review from the commission, file an itemized proposed budget with the staff and the applicant estimating the actual and added costs that are likely to be incurred during such review. The proposed budget shall justify each line item amount and explain how each line item is reasonably related to the matters which the agency is requested to review. A local agency's failure to file a proposed budget within the time period specified herein shall not prevent it from receiving reimbursement; however, failure to use the approval process described in this section creates a risk that the local agency will not be reimbursed for work already performed."

James Bezek - Solano County Department of Resource Management		PROJECT TRACKING				TOTAL COST
DATE	Activity/Products Produced	APPLICATION Time	Direct Cost	COMMENT LETTER Time	Direct Cost	
1-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
Weekly Total		0.00	0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

19-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - COMMENT LETTER FRAMING, APPLICATION REVIEW, CAO UPDATE	2.00	287.08	1.00	143.54	430.62
14-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - INITIAL MEETING TO FRAME COMMENT LETTER IN RESPONSE TO CEC REQUEST, APPLICATION	2.00	287.08	1.00	143.54	430.62
15-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - COMMENT LETTER DRAFTING, APPLICATION REVIEW	1.00	143.54	1.00	143.54	287.08
16-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - Letter content review		0.00	1.50	215.31	215.31
22-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - Letter content review		0.00	1.50	215.31	215.31
23-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - Letter content review		0.00	1.00	143.54	143.54

26-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - Coordination meetings and letter outline		0.00	2.00	287.08	287.08
27-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - Letter content review		0.00	1.00	143.54	143.54
28-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Dec-24	CORBY Project - Finalize and Submit Letter		0.00	3.00	430.62	430.62
3-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
GRANT TOTAL		5.00	717.70	13.00	1866.02	2583.72

Allan Calder - Solano County Department of Resource Management		PROJECT TRACKING				TOTAL COST
DATE	Activity/Products Produced	APPLICATION Time	Direct Cost	COMMENT LETTER Time	Direct Cost	
1-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
Weekly Total		0.00	0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

19-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Nov-24	CORBY APPLICATION DISCUSSION - AB205 PROCESS AND BOARD MEETING DEBRIEF RE COMMENT LETTER	1.00	143.54		0.00	143.54
14-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - INITIAL MEETING TO FRAME COMMENT LETTER IN RESPONSE TO CEC REQUEST		0.00	1.00	143.54	143.54
15-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - COMMENT LETTER CHECK IN		0.00	0.50	71.77	71.77
22-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - COMMENT LETTER CHECK IN		0.00	0.50	71.77	71.77
23-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - COMMENT LETTER CHECK IN		0.00	1.00	143.54	143.54

26-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Dec-24	CORBY PROJECT - COMMENT LETTER REVIEW		0.00	0.50	71.77	71.77
3-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
GRANT TOTAL		1.00	143.54	3.50	502.39	645.93

Narcisa Untal - Solano County Department of Resource Management		PROJECT TRACKING				TOTAL COST
		APPLICATION		COMMENT LETTER		
DATE	Activity/Products Produced	Time	Direct Cost	Time	Direct Cost	
1-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
Weekly Total		0.00	0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

10-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Nov-24	AB 205 Bill review for Corby BESS application	1.00	143.54		0.00	143.54

14-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - INITIAL MEETING TO FRAME COMMENT LETTER IN RESPONSE TO CEC REQUEST		0.00	1.00	143.54	143.54
15-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

19-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
GRANT TOTAL		1.00	143.54	1.00	143.54	287.08

Erik Hagstrom - Solano County Department of Resource Management		PROJECT TRACKING				TOTAL COST
DATE	Activity/Products Produced	APPLICATION Time	Direct Cost	COMMENT LETTER Time	Direct Cost	
1-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
Weekly Total		0.00	0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

19-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Nov-24					0.00	0.00
12-Nov-24					0.00	0.00
13-Nov-24	AB 205 Bill review for Corby BESS application	1.00	143.54		0.00	143.54
14-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - INITIAL MEETING TO FRAME COMMENT LETTER IN RESPONSE TO CEC REQUEST and Letter Preparation		0.00	2.00	287.08	287.08
15-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Nov-24	Corby Application Review and Comment Letter prep		0.00	2.50	358.85	358.85
19-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Nov-24	Corby Application Review and Comment Letter prep	1.00	143.54	2.50	358.85	502.39
22-Nov-24	Corby Application Review and Group meeting to prepare comment letter		0.00	2.50	358.85	358.85
23-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

25-Nov-24	Corby Application Review and Group meeting to prepare comment letter	3.00	430.62	1.00	143.54	574.16
26-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

GRANT TOTAL		5.00	717.70	10.50	1507.17	2224.87
-------------	--	------	--------	-------	---------	---------

Misty Kaltreider - Solano County Department of Resource Management		PROJECT TRACKING				TOTAL COST
DATE	Activity/Products Produced	APPLICATION Time	Direct Cost	COMMENT LETTER Time	Direct Cost	
1-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
Weekly Total		0.00	0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

19-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - INITIAL MEETING TO FRAME COMMENT LETTER IN RESPONSE TO CEC REQUEST		0.00	1.00	143.54	143.54
15-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

26-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
GRANT TOTAL		0.00	0.00	1.00	143.54	143.54

Nedzlene Ferrario - Solano County Department of Resource Management		PROJECT TRACKING				TOTAL COST
		APPLICATION		COMMENT LETTER		
DATE	Activity/Products Produced	Time	Direct Cost	Time	Direct Cost	
1-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
Weekly Total		0.00	0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

22-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - DRAFT COUNTY COMMENT LETTER; MEETING RE COUNTY COMMENT LETTER		0.00	1.00	143.54	143.54
26-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

29-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
GRANT TOTAL		0.00	0.00	1.00	143.54	143.54

Matt Tuggle - Solano County Department of Resource Management		PROJECT TRACKING				TOTAL COST
DATE	Activity/Products Produced	APPLICATION	Direct Cost	COMMENT LETTER	Direct Cost	
1-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
Weekly Total		0.00	0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

14-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Nov-24	REVIEW OF STAFF ANALYSIS AND PREPARATION FOR COMMENTS ON COMMENT LETTER	2.00	287.08		0.00	287.08
22-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Nov-24	REVIEW OF STAFF ANALYSIS AND PREPARATION FOR COMMENTS ON COMMENT LETTER	1.50	215.31		0.00	215.31
27-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

19-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
GRANT TOTAL		3.50	502.39	0.00	0.00	502.39

Pejman Mehrfar - Solano County Department of Resource Management		PROJECT TRACKING				TOTAL COST
DATE	Activity/Products Produced	APPLICATION Time	Direct Cost	COMMENT LETTER Time	Direct Cost	
1-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
Weekly Total			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

29-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
GRANT TOTAL		0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00

Ed King - Solano County Department of Agriculture		PROJECT TRACKING				TOTAL COST
DATE	Activity/Products Produced	APPLICATION Time	Direct Cost	COMMENT LETTER Time	Direct Cost	
1-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
Weekly Total		0.00	0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

16-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Nov-24	Corby BESS Application Discussion	0.50	97.50		0.00	97.50
20-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Nov-24	Agriculture input for comment letter	2.00	390.00		0.00	390.00

22-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Nov-24	Comment letter meetings/review	1.00	195.00		0.00	195.00
24-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

29-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
GRANT TOTAL		3.50	682.50	0.00	0.00	682.50

Robyn Rains - Solano County Sheriff's Office/OES		PROJECT TRACKING				TOTAL COST
		APPLICATION	Direct Cost	COMMENT LETTER	Direct Cost	
DATE	Activity/Products Produced	Time	Direct Cost	Time	Direct Cost	
1-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
Weekly Total		0.00	0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

16-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Nov-24	CORBY APPLICATION DISCUSSION - AB205 PROCESS AND BOARD MEETING DEBRIEF RE COMMENT LETTER	1.00	143.54		0.00	143.54
14-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - INITIAL MEETING TO DRAFT COMMENT LETTER IN RESPONSE TO CEC REQUEST		0.00	1.00	143.54	143.54
15-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

22-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Dec-24	REVIEW COUNTY COMMENT LETTER		0.00	0.50	71.77	71.77
3-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

29-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
GRANT TOTAL		1.00	143.54	1.50	215.31	358.85

Debbie Vaughn - Solano County Administrator's Office		PROJECT TRACKING				TOTAL COST
DATE	Activity/Products Produced	APPLICATION Time	Direct Cost	COMMENT LETTER Time	Direct Cost	
1-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
Weekly Total		0.00	0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

19-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Nov-24	MEETING TO DISCUSS LETTER/REVIEW/EDIT COMMENT LETTER AND MEET WITH CAO		0.00	3.00	430.62	430.62
23-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

26-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
GRANT TOTAL		0.00	0.00	3.00	430.62	430.62

Emily Combs - Solano County Administrator's Office		PROJECT TRACKING				
DATE	Activity/Products Produced	APPLICATION	Direct Cost	COMMENT LETTER	Direct Cost	TOTAL COST
		Time		Time		
1-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
Weekly Total		0.00	0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

26-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
GRANT TOTAL		0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00

Nancy Nelson - Solano County Administrator's Office		PROJECT TRACKING				TOTAL COST
DATE	Activity/Products Produced	APPLICATION		COMMENT LETTER		
		Time	Direct Cost	Time	Direct Cost	
1-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
Weekly Total			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

13-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - INITIAL MEETING TO FRAME COMMENT LETTER		0.00	1.00	143.54	143.54
15-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

18-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Nov-24	1) MEETING WITH COUNTY COUNSEL ON BESS APPLICATION; 2) MTG WITH ED ON DRAFT LETTER		0.00	1.00	143.54	143.54
23-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Nov-24	MEETING WITH RESOURCE MGMT - BESS		0.00	1.50	215.31	215.31
26-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

24-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
GRANT TOTAL		0.00	0.00	3.50	502.39	502.39

Holly Tokar - Solano County/County Counsel		PROJECT TRACKING				
		APPLICATION		COMMENT LETTER		
DATE	Activity/Products Produced	Time	Direct Cost	Time	Direct Cost	TOTAL COST
1-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
Weekly Total		0.00	0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Jul-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Aug-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

16-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Oct-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
3-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - MEETING WITH STAFF RE FORMULATING COMMENT LETTER AND CBA OUTLINE REVIEW	1.00	143.54		0.00	143.54
14-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - INITIAL MEETING TO FRAME COMMENT LETTER IN RESPONSE TO CEC REQUEST		0.00	1.00	143.54	143.54
15-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - COUNTY COMMENT LETTER REVIEW AND EDIT.		0.00	4.00	574.16	574.16
21-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - COUNTY COMMENT LETTER REVIEW AND EDIT; MEETING RE COMMENT LETTER		0.00	5.00	717.70	717.70

22-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - COUNTY COMMENT LETTER REVIEW AND EDIT; MEETING RE COMMENT LETTER		0.00	3.25	466.51	466.51
23-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Nov-24	CORBY PROJECT - COUNTY COMMENT LETTER EDIT; MEETING RE COUNTY COMMENT LETTER		0.00	3.00	430.62	430.62
26-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
29-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Nov-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
1-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
2-Dec-24	CORBY PROJECT - REVIEW COUNTY COMMENT LETTER		0.00	0.50	71.77	71.77
3-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
4-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
5-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
6-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
7-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
8-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
9-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
10-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
11-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
12-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
13-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
14-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
15-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
16-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
17-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
18-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
19-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
20-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
21-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
22-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
23-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
24-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
25-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
26-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
27-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
28-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00

29-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
30-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
31-Dec-24			0.00		0.00	0.00
GRANT TOTAL		1.00	143.54	16.75	2404.30	2547.84

DEPARTMENT OF RESOURCE MANAGEMENT

JAMES BEZEK
Director
jmbezek@solanocounty.com



675 Texas Street, Suite 5500
Fairfield, CA 94533-6342
(707) 784-6765
Fax (707) 784-4805

www.solanocounty.com

Via Email and e-filing Docket 24-OPT-05

December 4, 2024

Renee Longman
Project Manager
California Energy Commission
715 P Street
Sacramento, CA 95814
Renee.longman@energy.ca.gov

Re: Docket 24-OPT-05: County of Solano Request for Reimbursement Pursuant to Public Resources Code Section 25538

Dear Ms. Longman:

The County of Solano (“County”) submits this Reimbursement Request for the actual and proposed costs associated with its review of and comments on the Corby Battery Energy Storage System Project (“Project”) Opt-in Application (“Application”) filed by Corby Energy Storage, LCC (“Applicant”).

I. Reimbursement Request Justification

The AB 205, or “Opt-in,” statute states that Public Resources Code section 25538 applies to an application submitted under the Opt-in Program administered by the California Energy Commission (“CEC”). (Pub. Res. Code, § 25545.8.) Public Resources Code section 25538 provides that:

Upon receiving the commission's request for review under subdivision (f) of Section 25519 and Section 25506, the local agency may request a fee from the commission to reimburse the local agency for the actual and added costs of this review by the local agency. The commission shall reimburse the local agency for the added costs that shall be actually incurred by the local agency in complying with the commission's request... The commission shall either request a fee from the person proposing the project or devote a special fund in its budget, for the reimbursement of such costs incurred by local agencies.

Public Resources Code section 25519(f) requires CEC staff to forward the Opt-in application to local government agencies that are required to, “review the application and submit comments on, among other things, the design of the facility, architectural and aesthetic features of the facility, access to highways, landscaping and grading, public use of lands in the area of the facility, and other appropriate aspects of the design, construction, or operation of the proposed site and related facility.” On November 13, 2024, Solano County received a letter from CEC staff requesting the County’s input pursuant to Public Resources Code section 25519(f) and on Opt-in Program specific provisions under California Code of Regulations, title 20, section 1877.

Solano County's Reimbursement Request is set forth in detail in **Attachment A**. The Reimbursement Request lists a description of the various activities the County has conducted or will conduct consistent with its obligations under Public Resources Code section 25519(f), and as requested by the CEC on November 13, 2024. All line items in the proposed budget represent actual costs incurred to date, and a detailed estimate of anticipated activities, sub-activities, and costs eligible for reimbursement under Public Resources Code section 25538 and applicable law. The proposed budget is based on a reasonable estimate of time and resources necessary to perform tasks eligible for reimbursement, which includes cost estimates from staff, counsel, and anticipated proposals by environmental and technical consultants.

II. Reimbursement Request: Costs Incurred To-Date, including Initial Review of Project Application and County Comment Letter Submitted December 2, 2024.

The CEC's November 13, 2024, letter asked for County comments on the Corby BESS Opt-In Application at the County's "earliest convenience." Additionally, at the October 2, 2024, Opt-In Pre-Application Meeting, CEC staff advised the County that comments should be submitted in advance of the CEC's application completeness determination—which the County understands to be December 9, 2024—to ensure meaningful consideration.

In response to these requests from the CEC, the County submitted its initial comment letter on December 2, 2024. The County will submit further comments in the coming months consistent with its obligations and rights under law, including Public Resources Code section 25519(f) and California Code of Regulations, title 20, section 1877, once the County has adequate time to fully review the Application and any subsequent submittals but the Applicant.

The County is seeking reimbursement for its review of the Application and preparation of the County's December 2, 2024, comment letter. This includes time and costs for County staff in its Department of Resource Management, Department of Agriculture, Office of Emergency Services staff, County Administrator's Office, and the Office of County Counsel.

The County's review and comments to-date—for which it now seeks reimbursement—directly relate to the Application's compliance with California Code of Regulations, title 20, section 1877, and the Project's proposed design, construction, and operation. The County's review and proposed costs do not include the County's review or preparation of the Reimbursement Request. A detailed breakdown of eligible costs incurred through December 4, 2024, is included in **Attachment A**.

III. Reimbursement Request: Added Costs for Further and Supplemental Review, Including Analysis, Review, and Comments on Net Positive Economic Benefits, Community Benefits Plan and Agreement(s), Environmental Impacts, Design, Construction, and Operation of the Project, and Whether the Project is Required for the Public Convenience and Necessity

The County is seeking further reimbursement under Public Resources Code section 25538 for its estimated added costs associated with its further review of the Application consistent with California Code of Regulations, title 20, section 1877 and Public Resources Code section 25519. This includes further review and comments regarding (1) the purported net positive economic benefit of the Project; (2) the community benefits plan and agreement(s); (3) County environmental impacts; (4) the design, construction, and operation of the Project; and (5) whether the Project is required for the public

convenience and necessity. **Attachment A** includes an estimated breakdown of costs eligible for reimbursement under Public Resources Code section 25538 for each of categories.

IV. Development Impact and Permit Fees

The County is also authorized to seek reimbursement for “permit fees, including traffic impact fees, drainage fees, park-in-lieu fees, sewer fees, public facilities fees and the like, but not processing fees,” that the County would normally receive but-for the opt-in process. (Cal. Code Regs., tit. 20, §1878.1(a)(1)(A). At this time, the County is still evaluating what fees would apply to the proposed 300 MW BESS facility, and has provided its best estimate in **Attachment A**. The County will seek reimbursement to the extent authorized by law.

V. Conclusion

The County requests that the Commission deem this Reimbursement Request complete and authorize reimbursement consistent with Public Resources Code section 25538. The County appreciates the Commission’s attention to this request. Should you have any questions or concerns, please don’t hesitate to contact me. We look forward to working with the CEC to complete this process.

Sincerely,



James Bezek

Attachment A: Reimbursable Costs Incurred To-Date and Projected under Public Resources Code section 25538